FULTON COUNTY PURCHASING AND COMPLIANCE DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET - COUNTYWIDE SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICE

BID NUMBER No. #:

OPENING

221TB132332C-GS DATE:

2/14/2022

Purchasing Agent:
Gertis Strozier

BID DESCRIPTION:

SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL and RECYCLING SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:

DEPARTMENT OF REAL ESTATE AND ASSET MANAGEMENT

Georgia Waste Systems, LLC

Latham Home Sanitation Company,

d/b/a Inc
Waste Management '
ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
1571 Burks Drive 7756 B Hampton Place
Lake City, Georgia 30260 Loganville, GA 30052
TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE
(904) 293-3026 (770) 554-0455
CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:
Michael J.' Holbrook, Director of Richard F. Jarvis, Vice President
Public Sector Services
95 GALLON RECYCLING SERVICES
#of # of Pulls
No. Category Types of Facilties | Facilities |per Week| # of Weeks TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
1 Libraries 34 2 52 $183,440.40 $74,256.00
2 Senior Centers 17 2 52 $91,720.20 $37,128.00
3 Health Centers 10 3 52 $80,922.40 $32,760.00
4 Arts Centers 1 52 $18,874.96 $6,552.00
5 Cooperative Extension 2 52 $9,967.36 $4,368.00
6 Housing and Community Affairs 4 2 52 $19,935.24 $8,736.00
7 Public Works & DREAM 10 2 52 $49,836.80 $21,840.00
8 Multi-Agency Locations 5 14 52 $25,356.00 $76,440.00
9 Police Locations 2 2 52 $9,967.36 $4,368.00
10 |Registration and Elections 1 5 52 $9,085.44 $5,460.00
11 |[Sheriff Department 2 2 52 $9,967.36 $4,368.00
12 |[Public Safety 3 3 52 $24,276.72 $9,828.00
13 ||Other County Facilities 10 2 52 $53,991.60 $21,840.00
14 |(|Open Tops Facilities 2 6 52 $29,902.08 $13,104.00
15 ||Compactors Facilities 4 30 52 $43,601.12 $131,040.00
Total Cost for 95 Gallon Containainers for Recycling Services Line Iltems
#1 thru #15 $660,995.04 $452,088.00
95 GALLON SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICES for LIBRARIES
# ol # OT PUllS
No. Category Types of Facilties | Facilities |per Week| # of Weeks TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
1 Libraries 34 2 52 $183,440.40 $74,256.00
8 YARD FRONT LOADER SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICES
# o1 # o1 Pulls
No. Category Types of Facilties | Facilities |per Week| # of Weeks TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
1 Senior Centers 1 52 $25,806.04 No Bid
2 Health Centers 1 52 $16,698.24 No Bid
3 Arts Centers 1 52 $9,108.32 No Bid
4 Cooperative Extension 1 52 $3,036.28 No Bid
5 Housing and Community Affairs 1 52 $6,072.04 No Bid
6 Public Works & DREAM 1 52 $15,180.36 No Bid
7 Multi-Agency Locations 1 52 $7,590.44 No Bid
8 Police Locations 1 52 $3,036.28 No Bid
9 Registration and Elections 1 52 $1,518.40 No Bid
10 ||Sheriff Department 1 52 $3,036.28 No Bid
11 ||Public Safety 1 52 $4,554.68 No Bid
12 ||Other County Facilities 1 52 $15,180.36 No Bid
Total Cost for 8 Yard Front Loader for Solid Waste Services Line
13 |{items #1 thru #12 $110,817.72 No Bid
OPEN TOP & COMPACTORS SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICES
F ol F OT PUIIS
No. Category Types of Facilties | Facilities |per Week| # of Weeks TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
1 Open Tops 2 1 52 $53,369.16 No Bid
2 Compactors Facilities 4 2 52 $175,296.16 No Bid
Total Cost for Open Top & Compactors for Solid Waste Services
3 Line Items #1 thru #2 $228,665.32 No Bid

SHREDDING SERVICES

Description of Services

Rate Per Hour

Rate Per Hour

Rate Per Hour

Shredding cost shall include labor, material and disposal cost

N/A

$460.00

ADDITIONAL SERVICES SOLID WASTE SERVICES: Do Not In

clude as Part of Base Bid Amount

No. Description of Services Price Per Ton/Haul Price Per Ton/Haul Price Per Ton/Haul
1 Construction/Demolition $48.00 No Bid
2 Clearing/Grubbing Debris $48.00 No Bid
3 |Yard Waste Materiial $48.00 No Bid
4 Municipal Solid Waste (Household Garbage) $48.00 No Bid
5 Container Handling $250.00 No Bid
(1 +5) = Sub-Total Miscellaneous Service: $442.00 No Bid

Self-Haul Price Per Ton/Self Haul Price Per Ton/Self Haul Price Per Ton/Self Haul

1|1Dead Animals (Seltf Haul) $48.00 No Bid
2|Construction/Demolition (Self Haul) $48.00 No Bid
3|Yard Waste Material (Self Haul) $48.00 No Bid
4|Municipal Solid Waste (Self Haul) $48.00 No Bid
(1 + 4) = Sub-Total Self Haul: $192.00 No Bid
Total Additional Services: $634.00 No Bid

PER ITEM PRICING DUMPSTER SIZE : Do Not Include as Part of Base Bid Amount

Per Call Price/lncludes Delivery

Per Call Price/lncludes Delivery and

Per Call Price/lncludes Delivery

Dumpster Size and Pick-Up Pick-Up and Pick-Up
A |Three (3) CU. YDS $175.00 No Bid
B Four (4) CU. YDS $175.00 No Bid
C |[Six (6) CU. YDS $175.00 No Bid
D |Eight (8) CU. YDS $175.00 No Bid
E  |Twenty (20) CU. YDS $350.00 No Bid
F Thirty (30) CU. YDS $350.00 No Bid
G |Forty (404) CU. YDS $350.00 No Bid
H Self-Contained Unit N/A No Bid
I 95 - Gallon Cart $35.00 $21.00
BASE BID AMOUNT: $1,179,533.68 $526.344.00

BIDS MAILED

NO RESPONSE:

BIDS RECEIVED:

NO-BIDS: 1

CONTACT: Gertis Strozier, APA, C Team




