
25ITBC1410259C-JH 

Ballasts, Lamps, Light Fixtures and Related Supplies
Estimated Contract Value ($110000)

Total Awarded Value $ 0.00

Item No Description Quantity Price Total Cost

1 Ballasts 13W2/1 13/10 UNV-C 120/227V 40 25.64$       1,025.60$     

2 Ballasts 18W 2/1 18W-UNV-C 120/277V 60 26.79$       1,607.40$     

3 Ballasts 26W 2/1 26W 2/1 26W-UNV-C 120/277V 100 19.05$       1,905.00$     

4 Ballasts CFL 42W 120/277V ICF-2S42-M2-LD 20 27.50$       550.00$         

5 Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 2 x T8, 32 watts, 

120/277V Fluorescent lamps

300 8.95$         2,685.00$     

6 Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 3 x T8, 32 watts, 

120/277V Fluorescent lamps

50 12.86$       643.00$         

7 Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 4 x T8, 32 watts, 

120/277V Fluorescent lamps

150 13.04$       1,956.00$     

8 Ballast Emergency Fluorescent T-8, T-10 or T-12 

120/277V 1 lamp

15 191.79$     2,876.85$     

9 Ballast 250W MH, 120/277V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 87.29$       2,182.25$     

10 Ballast 400W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 101.79$     2,544.75$     

11 Ballast 175W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 75.95$       1,898.75$     

12 Ballast 100W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 47.62$       1,190.50$     

13 GROUP B  LAMPS & RELATED ITEMS:                             

Philips LED Floor Lamp, 7 WATT DIMMABLE

150 2.95$         442.50$         

14 PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 10 WATT LED 125 5.71$         713.75$         

15 PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 14 WATT LED 250 6.89$         1,722.50$     

16 PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp 9.5 WATT DIMMABLE 60 2.43$         145.80$         

17 PHILIPS Compact FL. Lamp, 26 watt - PL-C - 2-Pin 

(G24d-3) Base - 4,100K

150 2.35$         352.50$         

18 GE 97613 Compact FL. Lamp, F26DBX/841/ECO4P 150 2.52$         378.00$         

19 GE 97610 Compact FL. Lamp, F26DBX1 827/4 Pin or 

Equal

150 3.57$         535.50$         

20 GE F18DBX 835/ECO 4 Pin                              Compact 

FL. Lamp

200 4.17$         834.00$         

21 SYLVANIA CF13DS/835/ECO 300 2.08$         624.00$         

22 PHILIPS Fluorescent Lamp F17T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 2.68$         1,072.00$     

Batteries Plus 



23 PHILIPS Fluorescent Lamp F25T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 2.79$         1,116.00$     

24 PHILLIPS Fluorescent Lamp U-Bent FBO 32/841/U6 300 8.93$         2,679.00$     

25 PHILIPS Fluorescent Lamp, 4 Ft, F32T8/841/ECO 10000 2.08$         20,800.00$   

26 GE Fluorescent Lamp, F31T8/SPX35/U - 31 Watt - 

T8 - U-Bend 1-5/8 in. Spacing

300 8.98$         2,694.00$     

27 SYLVANIA Fluorescent Lamp, FBO31/841 U-Bend 300 8.98$         2,694.00$     

28 SYLVANIA  Tungsten Quartz lamp 250W DC 130 V 25 6.55$         163.75$         

29 SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz lamp 250W MC 130V 25 5.65$         141.25$         

30 SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz lamp 250W MC 130V 25 5.77$         144.25$         

31 SYLANVIA Tungsten Quartz lamp 150W DC 130V 25 5.06$         126.50$         

32 LED Lamp 9.5 WATT A-19 2200-2700K 100 1.04$         104.00$         

33 LED Lamp 12 -WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 1.75$         175.00$         

34 LED Lamp 16-WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 1.75$         175.00$         

35 LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 100.00$     2,500.00$     

36 LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 41.50$       1,245.00$     

37 LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 59.58$       1,787.40$     

38 LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 32.00$       800.00$         

39 MH Lamp, 100 watts, Medium Base, E-17, Average 

life 10000+ hrs. Open/Close Fixture Syl#64417

50 14.29$       714.50$         

40 MH Lamp, 175 watts, Mogul Base, E-28, Average 

life 10000+ hrs.

75 10.71$       803.25$         

41 MH Lamp, 250 watts, Mogul Base, E-28, Average 

life 10000+ hrs

75 10.71$       803.25$         

42 MH Lamp, 400 watts, Mogul Base, ED-28, Average 

life 10000+ hrs

75 11.90$       892.50$         

43 Lamp, MH 400 watts, BT-37 75 10.71$       803.25$         

44 MH Lamp, 175 watts, Medium Base, ED17, Average 

life 10000+ hrs

50 11.90$       595.00$         

45 GROUP C  LIGHT FIXTURES, LENS & RELATED ITEMS:                                            

Lay-In type, 2 FtX2 2GTL24 SWL MVOLT LP840 LED 

120V-227V 82 CRI 4000K

25 29.00$       725.00$         

46 Lay-In type, 2 FtX2 2GTL2 A12 120 LP840 LED 120V 30 27.00$       810.00$         

47 Lay-In type, 2 FtX2 Ft, U Bent Lamp Electronic 

ballast 120V

10 27.00$       270.00$         

48 Light Fixture, Exit/Emergency Light Combo, Cat. No. 

LHQM S W 3R 120/277

15 27.52$       412.80$         



49 WALL PACK LED 13 WATT 120/277V 12 38.40$       460.80$         

50 WALL PACK LED 20 WATT 120/277V 15 38.40$       576.00$         

51 WALL PACK LED 32 WATT 120/277V 15 35.71$       535.65$         

52 WALL PACK LED 153 WATT 120/277V 15 86.00$       1,290.00$     

Total :  $ 74,922.80



Price Total Cost Price Total Cost Price Total Cost Price

24.50$   980.00$         No Bid 36.80$   1,472.00$    17.25$ 

22.50$   1,350.00$      No Bid 37.60$   2,256.00$    17.25$ 

17.25$   1,725.00$      No Bid 37.26$   3,726.00$    17.25$ 

25.50$   510.00$         No Bid 46.40$   928.00$        27.60$ 

10.10$   3,030.00$      No Bid 17.76$   5,328.00$    12.36$ 

11.90$   595.00$         No Bid 20.81$   1,040.50$    13.74$ 

12.65$   1,897.50$      No Bid 24.00$   3,600.00$    14.89$ 

58.45$   876.75$         No Bid 95.66$   1,434.90$    49.45$ 

78.50$   1,962.50$      No Bid 119.90$ 2,997.50$    55.20$ 

79.95$   1,998.75$      No Bid 131.14$ 3,278.50$    66.70$ 

104.50$ 2,612.50$      No Bid 88.76$   2,219.00$    44.85$ 

46.50$   1,162.50$      No Bid 101.78$ 2,544.50$    

2.10$      315.00$         3.80$      570.00$        4.40$      660.00$        3.62$   

4.45$      556.25$         6.20$      775.00$        8.66$      1,082.50$    5.69$   

6.50$      1,625.00$      7.00$      1,750.00$    9.47$      2,367.50$    7.48$   

2.43$      145.80$         3.80$      228.00$        13.65$   819.00$        3.62$   

1.90$      285.00$         3.50$      525.00$        5.61$      841.50$        3.45$   

2.25$      337.50$         3.70$      555.00$        5.49$      823.50$        3.28$   

2.12$      318.00$         3.70$      555.00$        4.99$      748.50$        3.28$   

3.10$      620.00$         3.70$      740.00$        4.99$      998.00$        3.28$   

1.82$      546.00$         2.50$      750.00$        5.20$      1,560.00$    2.30$   

2.35$      940.00$         3.00$      1,200.00$    4.20$      1,680.00$    3.45$   

MEGA Wholesale 

LLC

E. Sam Jones 

Distributor
ESB LightLLC

Electrical 

Contractor Inc



2.50$      1,000.00$      3.20$      1,280.00$    5.76$      2,304.00$    3.45$   

8.05$      2,415.00$      9.20$      2,760.00$    16.18$   4,854.00$    10.06$ 

2.02$      20,200.00$    2.70$      27,000.00$  3.14$      31,400.00$  2.70$   

9.70$      2,910.00$      9.00$      2,700.00$    12.33$   3,699.00$    10.35$ 

9.75$      2,925.00$      9.00$      2,700.00$    14.97$   4,491.00$    10.35$ 

19.00$   475.00$         5.50$      137.50$        3.79$      94.75$          4.60$   

9.60$      240.00$         5.50$      137.50$        14.97$   374.25$        4.31$   

11.00$   275.00$         5.50$      137.50$        14.97$   374.25$        4.31$   

16.95$   423.75$         5.50$      137.50$        5.59$      139.75$        4.31$   

1.36$      136.00$         No Bid 5.29$      529.00$        12.08$ 

1.90$      190.00$         No Bid 3.50$      350.00$        No Bid

2.90$      290.00$         No Bid 2.71$      271.00$        No Bid

90.65$   2,266.25$      89.00$   2,225.00$    216.70$ 5,417.50$    69.00$ 

72.85$   2,185.50$      42.00$   1,260.00$    86.53$   2,595.90$    40.25$ 

54.00$   1,620.00$      41.00$   1,230.00$    81.17$   2,435.10$    24.15$ 

39.50$   987.50$         51.00$   1,275.00$    74.03$   1,850.75$    40.25$ 

13.25$   662.50$         15.00$   750.00$        19.40$   970.00$        17.19$ 

10.05$   753.75$         16.50$   1,237.50$    19.40$   1,455.00$    16.04$ 

10.05$   753.75$         16.50$   1,237.50$    19.40$   1,455.00$    16.04$ 

10.50$   787.50$         16.50$   1,237.50$    21.18$   1,588.50$    16.04$ 

9.20$      690.00$         16.50$   1,237.50$    22.52$   1,689.00$    16.04$ 

11.00$   550.00$         14.50$   725.00$        21.18$   1,059.00$    14.66$ 

73.15$   1,828.75$      59.00$   1,475.00$    183.95$ 4,598.75$    No Bid

52.50$   1,575.00$      45.00$   1,350.00$    154.53$ 4,635.90$    No Bid

52.50$   525.00$         No Bid 154.53$ 1,545.30$    No Bid

18.50$   277.50$         51.50$   772.50$        66.22$   993.30$        No Bid



55.95$   671.40$         No Bid 139.81$ 1,677.72$    No Bid

55.95$   839.25$         No Bid 169.24$ 2,538.60$    No Bid

26.50$   397.50$         No Bid 272.26$ 4,083.90$    No Bid

97.50$   1,462.50$      120.00$ 1,800.00$    404.70$ 6,070.50$    No Bid

Total :  $ 74,702.45 Total :  $ 62,450.5 Total :  $ 137,946.12 Total :  $ 73,431.95



Total Cost Price Total Cost Price Total Cost

690.00$               15.56$   622.40$             28.12$   1,124.80$    

1,035.00$           17.78$   1,066.80$         27.92$   1,675.20$    

1,725.00$           18.89$   1,889.00$         24.32$   2,432.00$    

552.00$               22.22$   444.40$             31.26$   625.20$        

3,708.00$           8.33$      2,499.00$         15.84$   4,752.00$    

687.00$               12.00$   600.00$             15.29$   764.50$        

2,233.50$           13.26$   1,989.00$         15.54$   2,331.00$    

741.75$               59.89$   898.35$             86.59$   1,298.85$    

1,380.00$           83.33$   2,083.25$         164.88$ 4,122.00$    

1,667.50$           83.33$   2,083.25$         167.13$ 4,178.25$    

1,121.25$           53.33$   1,333.25$         132.98$ 3,324.50$    

69.16$   1,729.00$         178.44$ 4,461.00$    

543.00$               2.22$      333.00$             6.02$      903.00$        

711.25$               4.61$      576.25$             6.96$      870.00$        

1,870.00$           4.72$      1,180.00$         7.96$      1,990.00$    

217.20$               3.33$      199.80$             12.81$   768.60$        

517.50$               3.22$      483.00$             5.31$      796.50$        

492.00$               2.78$      417.00$             5.31$      796.50$        

492.00$               2.78$      417.00$             5.31$      796.50$        

656.00$               2.50$      500.00$             5.31$      1,062.00$    

690.00$               2.22$      666.00$             3.81$      1,143.00$    

1,380.00$           2.69$      1,076.00$         10.14$   4,056.00$    

MEGA Wholesale 

LLC

Summit Lighting 

Solutions
Voss Lighting



1,380.00$           3.06$      1,224.00$         9.65$      3,860.00$    

3,018.00$           10.99$   3,297.00$         16.01$   4,803.00$    

27,000.00$         1.83$      18,300.00$       2.49$      24,900.00$  

3,105.00$           7.91$      2,373.00$         20.08$   6,024.00$    

3,105.00$           7.91$      2,373.00$         20.08$   6,024.00$    

115.00$               2.43$      60.75$               3.11$      77.75$          

107.75$               No Bid 6.72$      168.00$        

107.75$               2.87$      71.75$               5.51$      137.75$        

107.75$               3.59$      89.75$               5.33$      133.25$        

1,208.00$           0.91$      91.00$               4.20$      420.00$        

1.49$      149.00$             4.73$      473.00$        

1.73$      173.00$             4.09$      409.00$        

1,725.00$           84.62$   2,115.50$         131.58$ 3,289.50$    

1,207.50$           42.31$   1,269.30$         65.85$   1,975.50$    

724.50$               42.31$   1,269.30$         65.85$   1,975.50$    

1,006.25$           15.88$   397.00$             50.00$   1,250.00$    

859.50$               15.88$   794.00$             60.73$   3,036.50$    

1,203.00$           11.90$   892.50$             19.47$   1,460.25$    

1,203.00$           11.90$   892.50$             19.47$   1,460.25$    

1,203.00$           13.59$   1,019.25$         32.05$   2,403.75$    

1,203.00$           11.90$   892.50$             32.05$   2,403.75$    

733.00$               13.59$   679.50$             22.54$   1,127.00$    

81.26$   2,031.50$         56.18$   1,404.50$    

50.47$   1,514.10$         39.62$   1,188.60$    

50.47$   504.70$             

30.68$   460.20$             65.26$   978.90$        



56.57$   678.84$             85.98$   1,031.76$    

69.08$   1,036.20$         85.98$   1,289.70$    

75.09$   1,126.35$         161.35$ 2,420.25$    

141.99$ 2,129.85$         208.29$ 3,124.35$    

Total :  $ 73,431.95 Total :  $ 70,991.09 Total :  $ 123,521.21


