
HVAC Equipment and Parts
Estimated Contract Value ($75000)
Total Awarded Value $ 0.00

Item No Description Manufacturer Part # Brand Preference UOM Item No Quote type Manufacturer Part # Quantity

1 Multi-volt transformer, 24 VAC WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 1 Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3 18

2 3-Pole contactor, 208/240V Coil MANTOWOC 2006619 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 2 Alternate Manufacturer IRP DP330120F 8

3 3-Pole contactor, 40 Amps, 

208/230V Coil

None Brand Name or Equivalent Each 3 Specified Manufacturer None 8

4 Fan Relay 24 VAC WHITE ROGERS 90-380 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 4 Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS 90-380 18

5 Run Capacitor,15 Microfarad 

Rating,370-440VAC Voltage

TITAN PRO TRCF15 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 5 Specified Manufacturer TITAN PRO TRCF15 24

6 Universal Gas Valve HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 6 Alternate Manufacturer Resideo VR8345M4302 20

7 Thermostat Programmable 2 H/1C        

2 H/2C

HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat Brand Name or Equivalent Each 7 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat 20

8 Programmable Thermostat 

Programmable 1H/ 1C

HONEYWELL TH6110D1021 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 8 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL TH6110D1021 24

9 Thermostat Guard Box Plastic HONEYWELL TG512A1009 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 9 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL TG512A1009 18

10 Run Capacitor, 3 UF, 370 VAC DAYTON 2GE76 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 10 Alternate Manufacturer MARS 12903 36

11 Run Capacitor 7.5MFD 440VAC DAYTON 2MDY7 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 11 Alternate Manufacturer Jard 12931 24

12 Thermal Couple 36’’ HONEYWELL Q390A1061 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 12 Alternate Manufacturer Resideo Q390A1061 12

13 New Compressor - 5 Tons, 230 

Volts, 1Phase

COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent Each 13 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV 6

14 New Compressor - COPELAND 3 ½ 

Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase

COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent Each 14 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV 6

15 New Compressor - COPELAND 2 ½ 

Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase

COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent Each 15 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV 8

16 A/C Unit 24,000 BTU w electric heat GE AEE24DT Brand Name or Equivalent Each 16 Alternate Manufacturer Westinghouse WH425ZRC 8

17 A/C Unit 12,000 BTU w electric heat KOLDFRONT WAC12001W  Brand Name or Equivalent Each 17 Alternate Manufacturer Westinghouse WH412ZRB 6

18 Condensate Pump 0.033-HP 115V UTILITECH PRO UL-AC-PUMP Brand Name or Equivalent Each 18 Alternate Manufacturer Beckett CB201UL 20

19 Evaporator Coil Up Flow Down Flow 

1.5 -5 ton Encased

UNIVERSAL Brand Name or Equivalent Each 19 Alternate Manufacturer Goodman CAPF4860D6 12

20 Condensing Unit 5 Ton 208/230V CARRIER R4A460GKB Brand Name or Equivalent Each 20 Specified Manufacturer CARRIER R4A460GKB 10

21 Blower  Motor Universal, 3/4 HP, 

230v

GE 5KCP39PGV62 3CS Brand Name or Equivalent Each 21 Alternate Manufacturer IRP 2BM346B 12

22 Draft Inducer Motor RHEEM 70-101087-81 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 22 Alternate Manufacturer Protech 7010108781 12

F.M. Shelton Inc



23 Condenser Fan Motor, 3/4 HP, 

208/230v

CENTURY OAN460 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 23 Specified Manufacturer CENTURY OAN460 10

24 Circulator  Pump 115V 1/25HP Bell & Gossett NBF-22 Brand Name or Equivalent Each 24 Specified Manufacturer Bell & Gossett NBF-22 6

Total :  $ 76720.24



Price Total Cost Bid Rank Vendor Comment Buyer Comment Item No Quote type Manufacturer

15.36 276.48 1 1 Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS

31.53 252.24 2 2 Specified Manufacturer MANTOWOC

32.07 256.56 2 3 Specified Manufacturer None

7.76 139.68 2 4 Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS

2.77 66.48 2 5 Specified Manufacturer TITAN PRO

129 2580 2 6 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL

90.89 1817.8 2 7 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL

71.76 1722.24 1 8 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL

27.42 493.56 2 9 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL

1.75 63 2 10 Specified Manufacturer DAYTON

3.08 73.92 2 11 Specified Manufacturer DAYTON

6.54 78.48 2 12 Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL

915.42 5492.52 1 13 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND

759.16 4554.96 1 14 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND

630.96 5047.68 1 15 Specified Manufacturer COPELAND

957.27 7658.16 1 16 Specified Manufacturer GE

668.01 4008.06 2 17 Specified Manufacturer KOLDFRONT

53.76 1075.2 1 18 Specified Manufacturer UTILITECH PRO

883.18 10598.16 2 19 Specified Manufacturer UNIVERSAL

1985.13 19851.3 2 20 Specified Manufacturer CARRIER

144.08 1728.96 2 21 Specified Manufacturer GE

173.43 2081.16 2 22 Specified Manufacturer RHEEM

F.M. Shelton Inc Mechanical Maintenance



406.65 4066.5 2 23 Specified Manufacturer CENTURY

456.19 2737.14 2 24 Specified Manufacturer Bell & Gossett

Total :  $ 76720.24 Total :  $ 142604.68



Part # Quantity Price Total Cost Bid Rank Vendor Comment Buyer Comment Item No

90-T40M3 18 33.39 601.02 3 1

2006619 8 58.45 467.6 3 2

8 173.94 1391.52 3 3

90-380 18 20.26 364.68 3 4

TRCF15 24 17.92 430.08 3 5

VR8345M-4302 20 182.51 3650.2 3 6

TH6220U2000 Thermostat 20 142.08 2841.6 3 7

TH6110D1021 24 109.52 2628.48 3 8

TG512A1009 18 34.82 626.76 3 9

2GE76 36 15.64 563.04 3 10

2MDY7 24 17.11 410.64 3 11

Q390A1061 12 14.68 176.16 3 12

ZP49K5E-PFV 6 1837.23 11023.38 3 13

ZP38K5E-PFV 6 1622.97 9737.82 3 14

ZP24K5E-PFV 8 1362.36 10898.88 3 15

AEE24DT 8 1495.27 11962.16 3 16

WAC12001W  6 1841.71 11050.26 3 17

UL-AC-PUMP 20 122.1 2442 3 18

12 998.85 11986.2 3 19

R4A460GKB 10 4274.94 42749.4 3 20

5KCP39PGV62 3CS 12 283.03 3396.36 3 21

70-101087-81 12 286.41 3436.92 3 22

Mechanical Maintenance home depot pro



OAN460 10 521.15 5211.5 3 23

NBF-22 6 759.67 4558.02 3 24

Total :  $ 142604.68 Total :  $ 43869.52



Quote type Manufacturer Part # Quantity Price Total Cost Bid Rank Vendor Comment Buyer Comment

Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3 18 19.06 343.08 2

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 8 0 0 1

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 8 0 0 1

Specified Manufacturer WHITE ROGERS 90-380 18 6.06 109.08 1

Specified Manufacturer TITAN PRO TRCF15 24 2.64 63.36 1

Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302 20 113.95 2279 1

Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat 20 90 1800 1

Specified Manufacturer HONEYWELL TH6110D1021 24 83.97 2015.28 2

Alternate Manufacturer TAYMAC ZTC300 18 20.12 362.16 1

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 36 0 0 1

Alternate Manufacturer PACKARD TOCF7.5 24 2.34 56.16 1

Alternate Manufacturer ROBERTSHAW 1980-036 12 5.74 68.88 1

Specified Manufacturer COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV 6 1100 6600 2

Specified Manufacturer COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV 6 896.27 5377.62 2

Alternate Manufacturer GOODMAN ZP24K5EPFV830 8 650 5200 2

Specified Manufacturer GE AEE24DT 8 1108 8864 2

Alternate Manufacturer GARRISON MWDUJ2-12ERN1-MCJ9 6 409.46 2456.76 1

Alternate Manufacturer DIVERSITECH CP-22T 20 75.99 1519.8 2

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 12 0 0 1

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 10 0 0 1

Alternate Manufacturer NO BID NO BID 12 0 0 1

Specified Manufacturer RHEEM 70-101087-81 12 168.82 2025.84 1

home depot pro



Specified Manufacturer CENTURY OAN460 10 305.45 3054.5 1

Specified Manufacturer Bell & Gossett NBF-22 6 279 1674 1

Total :  $ 43869.52



Manufacturer Part # Brand Preference Delivery Address City

WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3 Brand Name or Equivalent

MANTOWOC 2006619 Brand Name or Equivalent

None Brand Name or Equivalent

WHITE ROGERS 90-380 Brand Name or Equivalent

TITAN PRO TRCF15 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TH6110D1021 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TG512A1009 Brand Name or Equivalent

DAYTON 2GE76 Brand Name or Equivalent

DAYTON 2MDY7 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL Q390A1061 Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

GE AEE24DT Brand Name or Equivalent

KOLDFRONT WAC12001W  Brand Name or Equivalent

UTILITECH PRO UL-AC-PUMP Brand Name or Equivalent

UNIVERSAL Brand Name or Equivalent

CARRIER R4A460GKB Brand Name or Equivalent

GE 5KCP39PGV62 3CS Brand Name or Equivalent

RHEEM 70-101087-81 Brand Name or Equivalent

CENTURY OAN460 Brand Name or Equivalent

Bell & Gossett NBF-22 Brand Name or Equivalent



Country State/Province Zip/Postal Code



Description UOM Quantity

Multi-volt transformer, 24 VAC Each 18

3-Pole contactor, 208/240V Coil Each 8

3-Pole contactor, 40 Amps, 208/230V Coil Each 8

Fan Relay 24 VAC Each 18

Run Capacitor,15 Microfarad Rating,370-440VAC Voltage Each 24

Universal Gas Valve Each 20

Thermostat Programmable 2 H/1C        2 H/2C Each 20

Programmable Thermostat Programmable 1H/ 1C Each 24

Thermostat Guard Box Plastic Each 18

Run Capacitor, 3 UF, 370 VAC Each 36

Run Capacitor 7.5MFD 440VAC Each 24

Thermal Couple 36’’ Each 12

New Compressor - 5 Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 6

New Compressor - COPELAND 3 ½ Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 6

New Compressor - COPELAND 2 ½ Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 8

A/C Unit 24,000 BTU w electric heat Each 8

A/C Unit 12,000 BTU w electric heat Each 6

Condensate Pump 0.033-HP 115V Each 20

Evaporator Coil Up Flow Down Flow 1.5 -5 ton Encased Each 12

Condensing Unit 5 Ton 208/230V Each 10

Blower  Motor Universal, 3/4 HP, 230v Each 12

Draft Inducer Motor Each 12

Condenser Fan Motor, 3/4 HP, 208/230v Each 10

Circulator  Pump 115V 1/25HP Each 6



Item No Organization Name Manufacturer Part #

1 F.M. Shelton Inc WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3

1 Mechanical Maintenance WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3

1 home depot pro WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3

2 F.M. Shelton Inc IRP DP330120F

2 Mechanical Maintenance MANTOWOC 2006619

2 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

3 F.M. Shelton Inc None

3 Mechanical Maintenance None

3 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

4 F.M. Shelton Inc WHITE ROGERS 90-380

4 Mechanical Maintenance WHITE ROGERS 90-380

4 home depot pro WHITE ROGERS 90-380

5 F.M. Shelton Inc TITAN PRO TRCF15

5 Mechanical Maintenance TITAN PRO TRCF15

5 home depot pro TITAN PRO TRCF15

6 F.M. Shelton Inc Resideo VR8345M4302

6 Mechanical Maintenance HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302

6 home depot pro HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302

7 F.M. Shelton Inc HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat

7 Mechanical Maintenance HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat

7 home depot pro HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat

8 F.M. Shelton Inc HONEYWELL TH6110D1021

8 Mechanical Maintenance HONEYWELL TH6110D1021

8 home depot pro HONEYWELL TH6110D1021

9 F.M. Shelton Inc HONEYWELL TG512A1009

9 Mechanical Maintenance HONEYWELL TG512A1009

9 home depot pro TAYMAC ZTC300

10 F.M. Shelton Inc MARS 12903

10 Mechanical Maintenance DAYTON 2GE76

10 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

11 F.M. Shelton Inc Jard 12931

11 Mechanical Maintenance DAYTON 2MDY7

11 home depot pro PACKARD TOCF7.5

12 F.M. Shelton Inc Resideo Q390A1061

12 Mechanical Maintenance HONEYWELL Q390A1061

12 home depot pro ROBERTSHAW 1980-036

13 F.M. Shelton Inc COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV

13 Mechanical Maintenance COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV

13 home depot pro COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV

14 F.M. Shelton Inc COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV

14 Mechanical Maintenance COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV

14 home depot pro COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV

15 F.M. Shelton Inc COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV

15 Mechanical Maintenance COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV

15 home depot pro GOODMAN ZP24K5EPFV830

16 F.M. Shelton Inc Westinghouse WH425ZRC



16 Mechanical Maintenance GE AEE24DT

16 home depot pro GE AEE24DT

17 F.M. Shelton Inc Westinghouse WH412ZRB

17 Mechanical Maintenance KOLDFRONT WAC12001W 

17 home depot pro GARRISON MWDUJ2-12ERN1-MCJ9

18 F.M. Shelton Inc Beckett CB201UL

18 Mechanical Maintenance UTILITECH PRO UL-AC-PUMP

18 home depot pro DIVERSITECH CP-22T

19 F.M. Shelton Inc Goodman CAPF4860D6

19 Mechanical Maintenance UNIVERSAL

19 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

20 F.M. Shelton Inc CARRIER R4A460GKB

20 Mechanical Maintenance CARRIER R4A460GKB

20 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

21 F.M. Shelton Inc IRP 2BM346B

21 Mechanical Maintenance GE 5KCP39PGV62 3CS

21 home depot pro NO BID NO BID

22 F.M. Shelton Inc Protech 7010108781

22 Mechanical Maintenance RHEEM 70-101087-81

22 home depot pro RHEEM 70-101087-81

23 F.M. Shelton Inc CENTURY OAN460

23 Mechanical Maintenance CENTURY OAN460

23 home depot pro CENTURY OAN460

24 F.M. Shelton Inc Bell & Gossett NBF-22

24 Mechanical Maintenance Bell & Gossett NBF-22

24 home depot pro Bell & Gossett NBF-22



Quote type Bid Rank Quantity Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

Specified Manufacturer 1 18 15.36 276.48

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 33.39 601.02

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 19.06 343.08

Alternate Manufacturer 2 8 31.53 252.24

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 58.45 467.6

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 0 0

Specified Manufacturer 2 8 32.07 256.56

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 173.94 1391.52

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 0 0

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 7.76 139.68

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 20.26 364.68

Specified Manufacturer 1 18 6.06 109.08

Specified Manufacturer 2 24 2.77 66.48

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 17.92 430.08

Specified Manufacturer 1 24 2.64 63.36

Alternate Manufacturer 2 20 129 2580

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 182.51 3650.2

Specified Manufacturer 1 20 113.95 2279

Specified Manufacturer 2 20 90.89 1817.8

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 142.08 2841.6

Specified Manufacturer 1 20 90 1800

Specified Manufacturer 1 24 71.76 1722.24

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 109.52 2628.48

Specified Manufacturer 2 24 83.97 2015.28

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 27.42 493.56

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 34.82 626.76

Alternate Manufacturer 1 18 20.12 362.16

Alternate Manufacturer 2 36 1.75 63

Specified Manufacturer 3 36 15.64 563.04

Alternate Manufacturer 1 36 0 0

Alternate Manufacturer 2 24 3.08 73.92

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 17.11 410.64

Alternate Manufacturer 1 24 2.34 56.16

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 6.54 78.48

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 14.68 176.16

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 5.74 68.88

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 915.42 5492.52

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1837.23 11023.38

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 1100 6600

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 759.16 4554.96

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1622.97 9737.82

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 896.27 5377.62

Specified Manufacturer 1 8 630.96 5047.68

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 1362.36 10898.88

Alternate Manufacturer 2 8 650 5200

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 957.27 7658.16



Specified Manufacturer 3 8 1495.27 11962.16

Specified Manufacturer 2 8 1108 8864

Alternate Manufacturer 2 6 668.01 4008.06

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1841.71 11050.26

Alternate Manufacturer 1 6 409.46 2456.76

Alternate Manufacturer 1 20 53.76 1075.2

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 122.1 2442

Alternate Manufacturer 2 20 75.99 1519.8

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 883.18 10598.16

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 998.85 11986.2

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 0 0

Specified Manufacturer 2 10 1985.13 19851.3

Specified Manufacturer 3 10 4274.94 42749.4

Alternate Manufacturer 1 10 0 0

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 144.08 1728.96

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 283.03 3396.36

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 0 0

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 173.43 2081.16

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 286.41 3436.92

Specified Manufacturer 1 12 168.82 2025.84

Specified Manufacturer 2 10 406.65 4066.5

Specified Manufacturer 3 10 521.15 5211.5

Specified Manufacturer 1 10 305.45 3054.5

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 456.19 2737.14

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 759.67 4558.02

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 279 1674



Buyer Comment



Manufacturer Part # Brand Preference Delivery Address City

WHITE ROGERS 90-T40M3 Brand Name or Equivalent

MANTOWOC 2006619 Brand Name or Equivalent

None Brand Name or Equivalent

WHITE ROGERS 90-380 Brand Name or Equivalent

TITAN PRO TRCF15 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL VR8345M-4302 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TH6220U2000 Thermostat Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TH6110D1021 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL TG512A1009 Brand Name or Equivalent

DAYTON 2GE76 Brand Name or Equivalent

DAYTON 2MDY7 Brand Name or Equivalent

HONEYWELL Q390A1061 Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP49K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP38K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

COPELAND ZP24K5E-PFV Brand Name or Equivalent

GE AEE24DT Brand Name or Equivalent

KOLDFRONT WAC12001W  Brand Name or Equivalent

UTILITECH PRO UL-AC-PUMP Brand Name or Equivalent

UNIVERSAL Brand Name or Equivalent

CARRIER R4A460GKB Brand Name or Equivalent

GE 5KCP39PGV62 3CS Brand Name or Equivalent

RHEEM 70-101087-81 Brand Name or Equivalent

CENTURY OAN460 Brand Name or Equivalent

Bell & Gossett NBF-22 Brand Name or Equivalent

Total



Country State/Province Zip/Postal Code



Description UOM Quantity

Multi-volt transformer, 24 VAC Each 18

3-Pole contactor, 208/240V Coil Each 8

3-Pole contactor, 40 Amps, 208/230V Coil Each 8

Fan Relay 24 VAC Each 18

Run Capacitor,15 Microfarad Rating,370-440VAC Voltage Each 24

Universal Gas Valve Each 20

Thermostat Programmable 2 H/1C        2 H/2C Each 20

Programmable Thermostat Programmable 1H/ 1C Each 24

Thermostat Guard Box Plastic Each 18

Run Capacitor, 3 UF, 370 VAC Each 36

Run Capacitor 7.5MFD 440VAC Each 24

Thermal Couple 36’’ Each 12

New Compressor - 5 Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 6

New Compressor - COPELAND 3 ½ Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 6

New Compressor - COPELAND 2 ½ Tons, 230 Volts, 1Phase Each 8

A/C Unit 24,000 BTU w electric heat Each 8

A/C Unit 12,000 BTU w electric heat Each 6

Condensate Pump 0.033-HP 115V Each 20

Evaporator Coil Up Flow Down Flow 1.5 -5 ton Encased Each 12

Condensing Unit 5 Ton 208/230V Each 10

Blower  Motor Universal, 3/4 HP, 230v Each 12

Draft Inducer Motor Each 12

Condenser Fan Motor, 3/4 HP, 208/230v Each 10

Circulator  Pump 115V 1/25HP Each 6



F.M. Shelton Inc

Quote type Bid Rank Quantity Price Total Cost Vendor Comment

Specified Manufacturer 1 18 15.36 276.48

Alternate Manufacturer 2 8 31.53 252.24

Specified Manufacturer 2 8 32.07 256.56

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 7.76 139.68

Specified Manufacturer 2 24 2.77 66.48

Alternate Manufacturer 2 20 129 2580

Specified Manufacturer 2 20 90.89 1817.8

Specified Manufacturer 1 24 71.76 1722.24

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 27.42 493.56

Alternate Manufacturer 2 36 1.75 63

Alternate Manufacturer 2 24 3.08 73.92

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 6.54 78.48

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 915.42 5492.52

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 759.16 4554.96

Specified Manufacturer 1 8 630.96 5047.68

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 957.27 7658.16

Alternate Manufacturer 2 6 668.01 4008.06

Alternate Manufacturer 1 20 53.76 1075.2

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 883.18 10598.16

Specified Manufacturer 2 10 1985.13 19851.3

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 144.08 1728.96

Alternate Manufacturer 2 12 173.43 2081.16

Specified Manufacturer 2 10 406.65 4066.5

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 456.19 2737.14

76720.24



Mechanical Maintenance

Buyer Comment Quote type Bid Rank Quantity Price Total Cost

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 33.39 601.02

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 58.45 467.6

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 173.94 1391.52

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 20.26 364.68

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 17.92 430.08

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 182.51 3650.2

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 142.08 2841.6

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 109.52 2628.48

Specified Manufacturer 3 18 34.82 626.76

Specified Manufacturer 3 36 15.64 563.04

Specified Manufacturer 3 24 17.11 410.64

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 14.68 176.16

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1837.23 11023.38

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1622.97 9737.82

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 1362.36 10898.88

Specified Manufacturer 3 8 1495.27 11962.16

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 1841.71 11050.26

Specified Manufacturer 3 20 122.1 2442

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 998.85 11986.2

Specified Manufacturer 3 10 4274.94 42749.4

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 283.03 3396.36

Specified Manufacturer 3 12 286.41 3436.92

Specified Manufacturer 3 10 521.15 5211.5

Specified Manufacturer 3 6 759.67 4558.02

142604.68



home depot pro

Vendor Comment Buyer Comment Quote type Bid Rank Quantity Price

Specified Manufacturer 2 18 19.06

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 0

Alternate Manufacturer 1 8 0

Specified Manufacturer 1 18 6.06

Specified Manufacturer 1 24 2.64

Specified Manufacturer 1 20 113.95

Specified Manufacturer 1 20 90

Specified Manufacturer 2 24 83.97

Alternate Manufacturer 1 18 20.12

Alternate Manufacturer 1 36 0

Alternate Manufacturer 1 24 2.34

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 5.74

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 1100

Specified Manufacturer 2 6 896.27

Alternate Manufacturer 2 8 650

Specified Manufacturer 2 8 1108

Alternate Manufacturer 1 6 409.46

Alternate Manufacturer 2 20 75.99

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 0

Alternate Manufacturer 1 10 0

Alternate Manufacturer 1 12 0

Specified Manufacturer 1 12 168.82

Specified Manufacturer 1 10 305.45

Specified Manufacturer 1 6 279



Total Cost Vendor Comment Buyer Comment

343.08

0

0

109.08

63.36

2279

1800

2015.28

362.16

0

56.16

68.88

6600

5377.62

5200

8864

2456.76

1519.8

0

0

0

2025.84

3054.5

1674

43869.52



Organization Name Bid Exception Bid Exception Description

F.M. Shelton Inc No

home depot pro Yes There are "no bid" items included.

Mechanical Maintenance No

Bid Exceptions


