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3,000$             11,000$      14,000$       
$167,642.00 $1,258.66 $7,728.08 $7,059.40

Line 
Item

Item Number Manufacturer Item Number Brand Preference UOM Qty Delivery Location SELECTED BID 
PRICE TOTAL

SELECTED
 VENDOR

SELECTED
BID PRICE

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

1

BALLISTIC VEST -2-piece concEAlable  light-weight (less than .7 pounds) 
offering low-profile system (less than .15") with NIJ protection Level rating 
Type IIIA, w/ 2(two) Navy Blue covers and MIN 5 Year warranty, NIJ SPECs 
required

GH ARMOR HELIXIIIA NIJ SPECs required EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$20,625.00 T & T $825.00  NO BID $825.00 $1,280.00 

2 TACTICAL SOFTSHELL JACKET, TRU SPEC 24/7 SERIES #2454-BLK, BLACK; 
Patches -2 Shoulder & 1 Left Chest applied/Name Embroidered Right Chest

TRU SPEC #2454-BLK
Tru Spec No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$2,250.00 SPD $90.00  NO BID $158.75 $90.00 

3
COLORBLOCK SOFTSHELL JACKET, BLAUER #4670-84, DARK NAVY W RED; 
Patches -2 Shoulder & 1 Left Chest applied/Name Embroidered Right Chest * 
RANGE STAFF ONLY*

BLAUER #4670-84 Blauer No exceptions EA 3
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$405.00 SPD $135  NO BID $158.75 $135 

4 PULLOVER SWEATER, NAVY W/EPAULETS & BADGE TAB, LIBERTY  #140MNV LIBERTY 140mnv
Liberty or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,075.00 SPD $43.00  NO BID $54 $43 

5 TRUSPEC H20 PROOF 3-IN-1 JACKET  with LINER, #2413 BLACK, 2.5 oz. 100% 
Tactical Nylon

TRU SPEC #2413 BLACK
Tru Spec or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$4,375.00 SPD $175  NO BID $215.95 $175.00 

6 REVERSIBLE RAIN JACKET w/HOOD-LONG, SAFETY FORCES #5003RCH3M 
(BLK/LIME)

RADIANS #5003RCH3M
Safety Forces No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,625.00 SPD $105.00  NO BID  NO BID $105.00 

7 REVERSIBLE RAIN JACKET w/ HOOD-SHORT, SAFETY FORCES #475RJ:H1 
(BLK/LIME)

RADIANS  #475RJ:H1
Safety Forces No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,875.00 SPD $75.00  NO BID  NO BID $75.00 

8 RAIN TROUSER, SAFETY FORCES #475PTD, BLACK RADIANS #475PTD
Safety Forces No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,125.00 SPD $45.00  NO BID  NO BID $45.00 

9 NEOPRENE GLOVES, Damsacus Enforcer, BLACK TRU SPEC 3803
Tru Spec or equal 

quality
pair 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$323.75 T & T $12.95  NO BID $12.95 $20.00 

10 SWAT GLOVES 5.11 GL1268, BLACK 5.11 GL1268 5.11 or equal quality pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$500.00 SPD $20.00  NO BID $30.00 $20.00 

11 TRAFFIC GLOVES, Blauer gloves, G/1049, BLACK HALTZ HDT Haltz or equal quality pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$824.75 T & T $32.99  NO BID $32.99 $34.00 

12 COLD WEATHER GLOVES W/THERMOLITE LINING, ROTHCO #5469, BLACK ROTHCO #5469, BLACK
Rotcho or equal 

quality
pair 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$437.50 SPD $17.50  NO BID $22.00 $17.50 

13 GLOVE CARRIER, SAFARILAND, #33-4V, BLACK Dutyman 3421
Safariland or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$433.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 
Supply, 

Inc.

$17.32 $17.32 $26.25 $18.75 

14 ANSI TRAFFIC VEST, PREMIER EMBLEM PV1006-Marshal front/back PREMIER EMBLEM PV1006-M
Premier of Emblem No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$850.00 SPD $34.00  NO BID $51.00 $34.00 

15 NEW:  5.11 STRYKE PANT (Charcoal) 5.11 74369-018
5.11 STRYKE or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,875.00 SPD $75.00  NO BID $80.00 $75.00 

16 NEW: Men’s 5.11 Tactical TacLite Pro Mens Ripstop Pants (Charcoal) 5.11 74273-018
5.11 TacLite No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,123.75 SPD $44.95  NO BID $55.00 $44.95 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

17 NEW:  Women’s 5.11 Tactical TacLite Pro Women's Ripstop Pants (Charcoal) 5.11 64360-018
5.11 TacLite No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,123.75 SPD $44.95  NO BID $55.00 $44.95 

18 NEW:  5.11 STRYKE PANT (Green/Khaki)                                  5.11 74369-XX
5.11 TacLite No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,875.00 SPD $75.00  NO BID $80.00 $75.00 

19 Men’s 5.11 Tactical TacLite Pro Mens Ripstop Pants (Green/Khaki) 5.11 74723
5.11 TacLite No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,123.75 SPD $44.95  NO BID $55.00 $44.95 

20 Women’s 5.11 Tactical TacLite Pro Women's Ripstop Pants (Green/Khaki) 5.11 64360
5.11 TacLite No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,123.75 SPD $44.95  NO BID $55.00 $44.95 

21 SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, MEN, S/S ONLY  w/mic clips/pen 
holders, BLACK w/RANK APPLIED

5.11 71049 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,212.50 SPD $48.50  NO BID $59.00 $48.50 

22 SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, WOMEN, S/S ONLY  w/mic clips/pen 
holders, BLACK w/RANK APPLIED

5.11 61165 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,212.50 SPD $48.50  NO BID $59.00 $48.50 

23 SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, MEN, L/S ONLY  w/mic clips/pen 
holders, BLACK  w/RANK APPLIED

5.11 72049 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,362.50 SPD $54.50  NO BID $64.00 $54.50 

24 SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, WOMEN, L/S ONLY  w/mic clips/pen 
holders, BLACK  w/RANK APPLIED

5.11 62408 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,362.50 SPD $54.50  NO BID $64.00 $54.50 

25  SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, S/S ONLY WHITE, RED, GREY, ROYAL 
BLUE, MEN'S SIZE

5.11 71049 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,448.75 SPD $57.95  NO BID $68.00 $57.95 

26  SHIRT, 5.11 SNAG-FREE POLYESTER POLO, S/S ONLY  w/mic WHITE, RED, 
GREY, ROYAL BLUE, WOMEN'S SIZE

5.11 61165 5.11 No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,448.75 SPD $57.95  NO BID $68.00 $57.95 

27
TROUSERS - (MEN'S) FRENCH BLUE  WITH STRAIGHT SIDE POCKETS, KEYSTONE 
BELT LOOPS, SECRUITY TAB LEFT HIP POCKET, POLYESTER BLEND, 
SouthEAstern #9008

SouthEAstern 3900-26
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,573.75 T & T $62.95  NO BID $62.95 NO BID

28

SHIRT - (MEN'S) DUTY -S/S POLYESTER, Zippered front closure with buttons, 
permanent military stitched crEAses, plEAted pockets with velcro secured 
flaps, hidden pencil compartment; shoulder epaulets, whistle chain loop or 
button, badge pin receiver; ELBECO Z3314N or comparable brand/quality, 
NAVY

ELBECO Z3314N
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$950.00 T & T $38.00  NO BID $38.00 $39.00 

29

SHIRT(MEN'S) DUTY -L/S POLYESTER, Zippered front closure with 
buttons,permanent military stitched crEAses, plEAted pockets with velcro 
secured flaps, hidden pencil compartment; shoulder epaulets, whistle chain 
loop or button;ELBECO Z3314N or comparable brand/quality,NAVY

ELBECO Z3144N
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,050.00 T & T $42.00  NO BID $42.00 $42.00 

30

SHIRT (WOMEN'S) DUTY  S/S POLYESTER, Zippered front closure with 
buttons,permanent military stitched crEAses, plEAted pockets with velcro 
secured flaps, hidden pencil compartment; shoulder epaulets, whistle chain 
loop or button;ELBECO Z3314N or comparable brand/quality, NAVY

ELBECO Z9314LCN
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$950.00 T & T $38.00  NO BID $38.00 $39.00 

31

SHIRT (WOMEN'S) DUTY  L/S POLYESTER, Zippered front closure with 
buttons,permanent military stitched crEAses, plEAted pockets with velcro 
secured flaps, hidden pencil compartment; shoulder epaulets, whistle chain 
loop or button;ELBECO Z3314N or comparable brand/quality, NAVY

ELBECO Z9814LCN
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,050.00 T & T $42.00  NO BID $42.00 $42.00 
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Lawmen's 
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32

TROUSERS - (WOMEN'S) FRENCH BLUE DUTY  WITH STRAIGHT SIDE POCKETS, 
KEYSTONE BELT LOOPS, SECRUITY TAB LEFT HIP POCKET, POLYESTER BLEND, 
FLYING CROSS #32247 (WOMEN'S), COMPARABLE TO FLYING CROSS OR 
BETTER IS ACCEPTABLE

FLYING CROSS 3900W-26
Southereastern or 

Flying Cross or Elbeco
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,573.75 T & T $62.95  NO BID $62.95 NO BID

33 NECKTIE, PREMIER, SAMUEL BROOME TIES, BLACK PREMIER EMBLEM
PT1300/PT1301/PT
1302/PT1303/PT13

04

Premier of equal 
quality

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$122.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 
Supply, 

Inc.

$4.91 $4.91 $6.00 $7.00 

34 EMBLEM FOOT LOOP "Y" SHIRT STAYS, 2-PACK PREMIER PREMIER P10015
Premier of equal 

quality
set 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$200.00 SPD $8.00 $8.52 $12.00 $8.00 

35 EMBLEM FOOT LOOP SHIRT STAY, 4-PACK PREMIER PREMIER P10003
Premier of equal 

quality
set 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$213.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 
Supply, 

Inc.

$8.52 $8.52 $12.00 $9.95 

36 TIE TACK IF144B, 2" x 1/4" TACK/PIN WITH 11/16" COLOR GA SEAL COLORS: 
SILVERTONE AND GOLDTONE.

SMITH & WARREN EA 1-5
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

37 5 STAR 1-PIECE CONSTRUCTED CAP, MIDWAY HATS, NAVY MIDWAY 5-STAR Midway No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,500.00 SPD $60.00  NO BID  NO BID $60.00 

38 MESH CONTRUCTED STRAP/BAND FOR MIDWAY 5 STAR CAP, MIDWAY CAP STRAP Midway No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$300.00 SPD $12.00  NO BID  NO BID $12.00 

39 RAIN HAT COVER W/BIB, MIDWAY MIDWAY RAINCAP COVER Midway No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$525.00 SPD $21.00  NO BID  NO BID $21.00 

40 FUR TROOPER HAT, MIDWAY TASLON CROWN WITH FAUX FUR-TRIMMED EAR 
FLAPS, NAVY

MIDWAY FUR TROOPER Midway No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$700.00 SPD $28.00  NO BID  NO BID $28.00 

41 CLASSIC STYLE  KNIT WATCH CAP WITH FOLD BRIM (NOT BEANIE STYLE), MACS SANMAR CP90 MACS or equal quality EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$200.00 SPD $8.00  NO BID  NO BID $80.00 

42 DICKIE, BLACK, PADULA PADULA 109-FCMD
Paudula or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$300.00 SPD $12.00  NO BID $16.00 $12.00 

43 CREW- NECK T-SHIRT, JERZEES 29M JERZEES 2000GL
Jersees or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$125.00 T & T $5.00  NO BID $5.00 $6.00 

44 CONCEALED HOLSTER SHIRT, S/S, #1226(Black); #1225(White) TRU SPEC 1226 5.11 OR TruSpec EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$998.75 SPD $39.95  NO BID $54.95 $39.95 

45 UNDERARMOR, T-SHIRT, S/S, #1216010,#1216007 UNDERARMOR 1216007-001
Underarmor or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$550.00 SPD $22.00  NO BID $25.00 $22.00 

46 UNDERARMOR, T-SHIRT, L/S, #1248196 UNDERARMOR 1248917
Underarmor or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$675.00 SPD $27.00  NO BID $30.00 $27.00 

47 CALF HIGH SOCKS, THORLO (2-pack) THORLO 2PK Thorlo or equal quality PACK 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$250.00 SPD $10.00  NO BID $30.00 $10.00 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

48 HEAVYWEIGHT CUSHIONED CREW SOCKS, BATES E11936270 (4PPACK) BATES E1170 Bates or equal quality PACK 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$300.00 SPD $12.00  NO BID $31.00 $12 

49 MERINO WOOL CALF SOCKS MERINO SKS
Merino or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$375.00 SPD $15.00  NO BID $32.00 $15.00 

50 DRESS SHOE, HIGH GLOSS OXFORD, BATES #22141/E22741, BLACK IN MEN'S & 
WOMEN'S

BATES E22741/E22141 Bates no exceptions pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,500.00 SPD $60.00  NO BID $79.95 $60.00 

51 DRESS BOOT, HIGH GLOSS CHUKKA ROCKY #00500-8, BLACK ROCKY 500-8 Rocky no exceptions pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,875.00 SPD $75.00  NO BID $106.00 $75.00 

52 UNDER ARMOUR 8" STELLAR BOOT, #1268951-001, BLACK UNDERARMOR UA 3024949 pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$2,000.00 SPD $80.00  NO BID $110.00 $80.00 

53 UNDER ARMOUR UA VALSETZ RTS, SIDE ZIP BOOT, BLACK UNDERARMOR UA 3023748/744 pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$2,375.00 SPD $95.00  NO BID $140.00 $95.00 

54 TACTICAL RESEARCH 6" KHYBER LIGHTWEIGHT TACTICAL BOOT, BELLEVILLE 
TR960Z, BLACK

TACTICAL 
RESEARCH

BELLEVILLE TR960Z pair 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$2,750.00 SPD $110.00  NO BID $144.00 $110.00 

55 VENDOR's BEST SELLER Boot, BLACK ( PLEASE SPECIFY)
VENDOR'S 

CHOICE
BELLEVILLE MAXX6Z/8Z PAIR 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,750.00 SPD $110.00  NO BID  NO BID $110.00 

56 NAME PLATE, GOLD TONE REEVES #50 REEVES SOLE Reeves EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$261.00 
Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$10.44 $10.44 $16.00 $15.00 

57 SERVING SINCE ACCESSORY ON NAME PLATE, REEVES #Y/S REEVES YSLE Reeves EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$248.25 
Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$9.93 $9.93 $16.00 $15.00 

58 "FCMD" COLLAR BRASS, BLACKINTON, #10 (GOLD TONE ONLY) BLACKINTON Custom Blackinton SET 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$588.75 
Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$23.55 $23.55 $37.70 $25.50 

59 COLLAR BRASS,  BLACKINTON #11 RANK INSIGNIA TO BE SPECIFIED; Goldtone 
only-CPL, SGT, LT, CPT

BLACKINTON J-Stock Blackinton SET 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$199.00 
Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$7.96 $7.96 $8.00 $9.95 

60 APPLY COLLAR SEW ON INSIGNIA, RANK TO BE SPECIFIED , SET, TO BE 
PROVIDED BY DEPT; Embroidered Rank-Patch Size 1"x1"; Appley pair per Shirt

SPD Sew Patch Provided by Dept EA 25
161 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$50.00 SPD $2.00 NO BID $6.00 $2.00 

61 COLLAR BRASS, BLACKINTON #11-4STAR GENERAL; Goldtone BLACKINTON Blackinton SET 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$450.00 T & T $18.00 $19.95 $18.00 $21.00 

62 COLLAR BRASS,  BLACKINTON #11 RANK INSIGNIA TO BE SPECIFIED; Goldtone 
only-MAJ and CHIEF

BLACKINTON J-Stock Blackinton SET 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$199.00 
Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$7.96 $7.96 $8.00 $9.95 

C:\Granicus\Legistar5\L5\Temp\0327bc55-2333-4248-8806-3380e22f47b6-Most Responsible Bid



Page 5 of 10

Line 
Item

Item Number Manufacturer Item Number Brand Preference UOM Qty Delivery Location SELECTED BID 
PRICE TOTAL

SELECTED
 VENDOR

SELECTED
BID PRICE

Lawmen's 
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63 LEATHER BACK-SUPPORT WITH KEEPERS, BW
BackUpBrace or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

64 UNCLE MIKE'S ULTRA DUTY BELT, #7094-1-UM UNCLE MIKE'S 7094-1
Uncle Mikes No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$756.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$30.26 $30.26 $61.00 $39.00 

65 VELCRO OVERBELT, SAFARILAND #94-4; Basketweave SAFARILAND 94
Safariland no 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,475.00 SPD $59.00  NO BID $92.50 $59.00 

66 VELCRO UNDERBELT, SAFARILAND #99-4; Basketweave SAFARILAND 99
Safariland no 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$812.50 SPD $32.50  NO BID $38.50 $32.50 

67 VELCRO KEEPERS, HIDDEN SNAP SAFARILAND #62-4-4HS; Basketweave DUTYMAN 2421/4 (Velcro)
Safailand or equal 

quality
SET 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$367.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$14.71 $14.71 $29.50 $19.00 

68 MAGAZINE HOLDER, SAFARILAND, #77; Basketweave SAFARILAND 77-383-48HS
Safariland no 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$29.00 SPD $725.00  NO BID $50.00 $29.00 

69 KEY RING, SAFARILAND #168-4; Basketweave DUTYMAN 2021
Safariland or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$352.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$14.11 $14.11 $22.50 $16.00 

70 SILENT KEY, RING, SAFARILAND #170-03 DUTYMAN 4221
Safariland or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$352.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$14.11 $14.11 $32.50 $22.75 

71 BADGE CASE and ID HOLDER, STRONG #85300; FULTON COUNTY MARSHAL'S 
DEPARTMENT in recessed lettering on front flaps with neck chain

STRONG 85300 Strong no exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$625.00 SPD $25.00  NO BID $42.00 $25.00 

72 SWIVEL HANDCUFF KEY, ZAK, #ZT14 ZAK ZAK or equal EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$162.50 T & T $6.50  NO BID $6.50 $7.95 

73 OC HOLDER, SAFARILAND, #38-4 STX (3.3 OZ. Can); Basketweave SAFARILAND 38-4-48HS
Safariland no 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$600.00 SPD $24.00  NO BID $41.50 $24.00 

74 WHISTLE PREMIER, #P4916 PREMIER P4916
Premier of equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$75.00 SPD $3.00 $3.35 $6.00 $3.00 

75 WHISTLE CHAIN, PREMIER, PREMIER GCS
Premier of equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$75.00 SPD $3.00 $5.51 $6.00 $3.00 

76 ASP BATON, #52611; Expandable Baton 21", 22", 26" ASP 52611 ASP No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$3,025.00 SPD $121.00  NO BID $177.00 $121.00 

77 ASP BATON (AUTO-LOCK), #22611; Expandable 21", 22", 26" ASP 22611 ASP No exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$3,625.00 SPD $145.00  NO BID $226.00 $145.00 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

78 ASP BATON HOLDER, SAFARILAND, STX, Basketweave SAFARILAND 35-F Safariland EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$650.00 SPD $26.00  NO BID $35.50 $26.00 

79 ASP ROTATING SIDEBREAK SCABBARD FOR EXPANDABLE BATON, #52633 OR 
52411

ASP 52633
ASP or Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,375.00 SPD $55.00  NO BID $68.00 $55.00 

80 COMPACT FLASHLIGHT, STREAMLIGHT, RECHARGEABLE, #75813; Stinger XT STREAMLIGHT 75813
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,957.25 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$118.29 $118.29 $251.00 $135.00 

81 Streamlight 75813 Replacement Battery STREAMLIGHT 75375
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$475.00 SPD $19.00 $19.26  NO BID $19.00 

82 STREAMLIGHT, #75175 Replacement Battery for Stinger STREAMLIGHT 75375
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$475.00 SPD $19.00 $24.54  NO BID $19.00 

83 STINGER FLASHLIGHT HOLDER,STX- #22097; Basketweave BIANCHI 22097
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$400.00 SPD $16.00  NO BID $20.25 $16.00 

84 STREAMLIGHT STRION LED FLASHLIGHT; W AC/12V DC 1 HOLDER #74301 STREAMLIGHT 74301
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,512.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$100.48 $100.48 $210.00 $145.00 

85 STREAmM LIGHt STRION LED Replacement Battery STREAMLIGHT 74175
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$658.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$26.34 $26.34  NO BID $27.00 

86 HOLDER FOR   STREAMLIGHT STRION LED; Basketweave DUTYMAN 3121
Sarailand or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$555.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$22.23 $22.23  NO BID $26.00 

87 Blackhawk Night-Ops, CF Flashlight Holder with Mod-U-Lok Attachment BLACKHAWK 75GH00BK
Blackhawk or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$347.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$13.91 $13.91  NO BID  NO BID 

88 STREAMLIGHT TLR-1, TACTICAL LED GUN LIGHT,#69260 STREAMLIGHT 69260
Streamlight Stinger No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$3,233.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$129.34 $129.34 $276.00 $135.00 

89 HOLSTER w/GUN LIGHT CUTOUT, GLOCK 21, SAFARILAND, #6360-3832-481; 
Basketweave, LH, RH

SAFARILAND 6360-3832 481
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$3,100.00 SPD $124.00  NO BID $176.00 $124.00 

90 HANDCUFFS, LINKED, PEERLESS #700 SERIES, #4710; Nickel, Black Oxide or 
Color Plated Blue

PEERLESS 4710
Peerless or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$684.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$27.36 $27.36 $37.70 $26.75 

91 HANDCUFFS, HINGED, PEERLESS #800 SERIES, #4801; Nickel, Black Oxide or 
Color Plated Blue

PEERLESS 4801
Peerless or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$913.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$36.52 $36.52 $53.10 $37.50 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

92 CLOSED HANDCUFF CASE, SAFARILAND #90-4HS; Basketweave SAFARILAND 90-4HS
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$668.75 SPD $26.75  NO BID $39.50 $26.75 

93 OPEN HANDCUFF CASE, SAFARILAND #090-18; Basketweave SAFARILAND 090-18
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$637.50 SPD $25.50  NO BID $36.50 $25.50 

94 HANDCUFFS, ASP Hinged TACTICAL, offer color options, #56132 ASP 56132
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,200.00 SPD $48.00  NO BID $62.00 $48.00 

95 ASP Handcuff Cases for Hinge # 56131 ASP 56131
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,200.00 SPD $48.00  NO BID $62.00 $48.00 

96 HANDCUFFS CASE, ASP TACTICAL, BLACK, #56136 ASP 56136
Safariland No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
 $1,00.00 SPD $40.00  NO BID $52.00 $40.00 

97 LEATHERMAN KICK MULTI-TOOL, ROTHCO LEATHERMAN #2991 ROTHCO 5255
Rotcho or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$624.75 T & T $24.99  NO BID $24.99  NO BID 

98 SEAT ORGANIZER, UNCLE MIKE, #UM5256 Portable Seat Organizer UNCLE MIKE'S 52562/53561
Uncle Mikes or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$925.00 SPD $37.00  NO BID  NO BID $37.00 

99 TICKET CLIP BOARD HOLDER, SAUNDERS #s12206, Offer Black and Silver SAUNDERS 12206
Saunders or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$775.00 SPD $31.00  NO BID  NO BID $31.00 

100 RECEIPT CLIP BOARD HOLDERS, SAUNDERS #10009, 10"H x 6-3/16"W x 1"D SAUNDERS 11018
Saunders or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$850.00 SPD $34.00  NO BID  NO BID $34.00 

101 RECEIPT CLIP BOARD HOLDERS, SAUNDERS #10017, 12-1/4"H x 6-1/4" W x 
3/4" D

SAUNDERS 10017
Saunders or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$868.75 SPD $34.75  NO BID  NO BID $34.75 

102 LETTER CLIP BOARD HOLDERS, SAUNTDERS #21017, 14-1/2"H x 9/1/8" W x 1"D SAUNDERS 21017
Saunders or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$950.00 SPD $38.00  NO BID  NO BID $38.00 

103 LEGAL CLIP BOARD HOLDERS, SAUNDERS #21018, 14-1/2"H 9-1/8"W x 1"D SAUNDERS 21018
Saunders or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,037.50 SPD $41.50  NO BID  NO BID $41.50 

104 BACKPACK, 5.11 TACTICAL RUSH 24 BACKPACK, #58601-019 - BLACK 5.11 56561 5.11 or equal quality EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$2,125.00 SPD $85.00  NO BID $130.00 $85.00 

105 RADIO CARRIER, BIANCHI,#79145, Basketweave BIANCHI 7314
Bianchi or equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,037.50 T & T $41.50  NO BID $41.50 $41.50 

106 HEARING PROTECTOR MUFF, PELTOR #RG-OTH-4 PELTOR RG-OTH-4 Peltor or equal quality EA 10
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$590.00 SPD $59.00 $72.32  NO BID $59.00 

107 OTIS TACTICAL GUN CLEANING SYSTEM, See GALLS Item #SA444, Otis MFG 
#750

HOPPE PC038 Galls or equal quality EA 10
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$270.00 SPD $27.00  NO BID  NO BID $27.00 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

108 TACTICAL OUTERBELT, WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, #44B4_BK BLACKHAWK 44B4_BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$439.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$17.56 $17.56 $32.45 $28.75 

109 TACTICAL INNERBELT,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, #44B1_BK BLACKHAWK 44B1_BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$336.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$13.46 $13.46 $24.95 $23.00 

110 TACTICAL BELTKEEPRS,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, 
#44B351BK

BLACKHAWK 44B351BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$282.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$11.31 $11.31 $20.95 $19.00 

111 TACTICAL AMMO CLIP HOLDER,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, 
#44A002BK

BLACKHAWK 44A002BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$526.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$21.06 $21.06  $38..45 $35.00 

112 TACTICAL HANDCUFF CASE,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, SINGLE, 
BLACKHAWK, #44A100BK

BLACKHAWK 44A0100BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$440.00 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$17.60 $17.60 $32.45 $29.50 

113 TACTICAL HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE, BLACKHAWK, #44A001BK BLACKHAWK 44A001BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$526.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$21.06 $21.06 $38.45 $34.00 

114 TACTICAL OC/MACE CASE,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, 
#44A501BK

BLACKHAWK 44A501BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$384.25 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$15.37 $15.37 $26.95 $25.00 

115 TACTICAL ASP BATON HOLDER,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, 
#44A700BK

BLACKHAWK 44A700BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

116 TACTICAL STINGER FLASHLIGHT HOLDER,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, 
BLACKHAWK, #44A203BK

BLACKHAWK 44A203BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$468.25 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$18.73 $18.73 $22.45 $31.00 

117 TACTICAL HOLSTER,  .45 cal; WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, SAFARILAND, STX 
W/GUNLIGHT CUTOUT; OFFER LEFT HAND AND RIGHT HAND

SAFARILAND 6360-3832-411 Safariland EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$3,100.00 SPD $124.00  NO BID  NO BID $124.00 

118 TACTICAL/DUTY RADIO CARRIER,  WEB/NYLON CONSTRUCTION, BLACKHAWK, 
#44A450BK

BLACKHAWK 44A450BK
Blackhawk No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$413.50 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$16.54 $16.54 $42.95 $28.00 

119 WAIST CHAINS, PEERLESS MODEL 700CTC-32 - DUAL RESTRAINT PEERLESS 4785
Peerless or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,248.75 SPD $89.95 $90.42 $129.20 $89.95 

120 WAIST CHAINS, PEERLESS MODEL 7002C-OS - WAIST CHAIN -OVERSIZE 
HANDCUFFS; Oversized chains and cuffs

PEERLESS 4765
Peerless or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,900.00 SPD $76.00 $77.23 $96.20 $76.00 

121 LEG IRONS, S&W 1900, GALLS ITEM #RS024 PEERLESS 4740
S&W, Galls or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,100.00 SPD $44.00 $46.55  NO BID $44.00 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

122 OVERSIZE LEG IRON, PEERLESS MODEL 705C; OVERSIZE LEG IRON and CUFFS PEERLESS 4750
Peerless or Equal 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$2,501.75 

Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
$100.07 $100.07 $156.40 $106.50 

123 BLAUER Body Worn Camera CARRIERS IN BLACK AND NAVY BLAUER 8375XP-BWR Blauer no exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$3,150.00 SPD $126.00  NO BID $150.00 $126.00 

124
HOODED SWEAT-SHIRT, HANES, #562; Naby Blue, Marshal Department's 2-
part Fitness Logo applied to Left Chest; Dept can provide photo of sample 
shirt/pants; offer sizes Small-5XL 

HANES  SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs

Hanes no exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$600.00 T & T $24.00  NO BID $24.00  NO BID 

125
SWEATS-PANTS, HANES, #973; Navy Blue, Marshal Department's 2-part Fitness 
Logo applied to Left front Upperleg, Dept can provide photo of sample 
shirt/pans; off sizes Small-5XL

HANES  SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs

Hanes no exceptions EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$550.00 T & T $22.00  NO BID $22.00  NO BID 

126 FITNESS SHORTS, SPORT TEK POCKET; No Logo Application; offer sizes Small-5-
XL

SPORT TEK  SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs

Sport Tek No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$300.00 T & T $12.00  NO BID $12.00  NO BID 

127 FITNESS SHIRT, SPORT TEK; 2-part Fitness Logo applied to Left Chest; Dept can 
provide photo of sample shirt/pants; offer sizes Small-5XL

SPORT TEK
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO

Sport Tek No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$350.00 T & T $14.00  NO BID $14.00  NO BID 

128 NEW PROPPER WOMEN'S UNIFORM. POLO, S/S,  -  #F5383, Offer LAPD NAVY 
and COBALT BLUE; ; offer sizes XS  thru 4XL. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$850.00 SPD $34.00  NO BID $46.50 $34.00 

129 NEW PROPPER WOMEN'S UNIFORM. POLO, L/S,  -  #F5396, Offer LAPD NAVY 
and COBALT BLUE; ; offer sizes XS  thru 4XL. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$950.00 SPD $38.00  NO BID $51.50 $38.00 

130 PROPPER I.C.E. POLO, S/S, WOMEN’s cut -  #F5327, Offer LAPD NAVY and 
ROYAL BLUE;  offer sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,050.00 SPD $42.00  NO BID $58.00 $42.00 

131 PROPPER I.C.E. POLO, L/S, WOMEN’s cut -  #F5357, Offer LAPD NAVY and 
ROYAL BLUE;  offer sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,100.00 SPD $44.00  NO BID $62.00 $44.00 

132 NEW PROPPER MEN'S UNIFORM. POLO, S/S,  -  #F5355, Offer LAPD NAVY and 
COBALT BLUE; ; offer sizes XS  thru 4XL. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$850.00 SPD $34.00  NO BID $46.50 $34.00 

133 NEW PROPPER MEN'S UNIFORM. POLO, L/S,  -  #F5356, Offer LAPD NAVY and 
COBALT BLUE; ; offer sizes XS  thru 4XL. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$950.00 SPD $38.00  NO BID $51.50 $38.00 

134 PROPPER I.C.E. POLO, S/S, MEN’s cut  #5341 PlEAse Provide, Offer LAPD NAVY;  
offer sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,050.00 SPD $42.00  NO BID $58.00 $42.00 

135 PROPPER I.C.E. POLO, L/S, MEN’s cut  #5315 PlEAse Provide, Offer COBALT 
BLUE and LAPD NAVY;  offer sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available. 

PROPPER
 SNAG-FREE, SS, 
VARIED COLORs 

with applied LOGO
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
 $1.175.00 SPD $47.00  NO BID $62.00 $47.00 

136

SWEATER, UNISEX, 2-POCKET, LONGER STYLE, CARDIGAN, BLACK, Tuff-Pil Plus 
383;  Offer sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available.  Provide costs for 
extended sizes, as applicable. Embroidered CIV Logo on Left Chest; CALEA 
Logo on Left Sleeve hem (Department will provide replica if not on file with 
vendor). Job Titiles to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on order 
form

EDWARDS 7059-010
Tuff-Pil or eaual 

quality
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,550.00 SPD $62.00  NO BID  NO BID $62.00 
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Lawmen's 
Shooters' 

Supply, Inc.
T & T  SPD

137

SWEATER, DEVON & JONES LADIES' V-NECK #D475W, LAPD NAVY, Offer sizes 
Small thru 4XL or largest size available. Embroidered CIV Logo on Left Chest; 
CALEAL Logo on Left sleeve hem (Department will provide replica if not on file 
with vendor). Job Titles  to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on 
order form

DEVON & JONES D475W
Devon & Jones No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,612.50 T & T $64.50  NO BID $64.50  NO BID 

138

SWEATER, DEVON & JONES MEN'S V-NECK #D475,  LAPD NAVY, Offer sizes 
Small thru 4XL or largest size available. Embroidered CIV Logo on Left Chest; 
CALEA Logo on Left sleeve hem (Department will provide replica if not on file 
with vendor). Job Titles to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on 
order form

DEVON & JONES D475
Devon & Jones No 

exceptions
EA 25

160 Pryor Street, SW, 
Suite J-102, 

Atlanta, GA  30303
$1,612.50 T & T $64.50  NO BID $64.50  NO BID 

139

LADIES JACKET:  ASH CITY-NORTH END ' TECHNO LITE, Item #78032, (UNLINED) 
Embroidered CIV Logo on Left Chest; CALEA Logo on Left sleeve hem 
(Department will provide replica if not on file with vendor). LAPD NAVY, Offer 
sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available.  Job Titles to be applied 1/2" 
above logo will be provided on order form.

ASH CITY - 
NORTH END

78032 Ash City-North End EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,512.50 T & T $60.50  NO BID $60.50  NO BID 

140

MEN'S JACKET:  ASH CITY-NORTH END TECHNO LITE, Item #88083, (UNLINED) 
Embroidered CIV Logo on Left Chest; CALEA Logo on Left sleeve hem 
(Department will provide replica if not on file with vendor). LAPD NAVY, Offer 
sizes Small thru 4XL or largest size available.  Job Titles to be applied 1/2" 
above logo will be provided on order form.

ASH CITY - 
NORTH END

88083 Ash City-North End EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,512.50 T & T $60.50  NO BID $60.50  NO BID 

141 JACKET, TRI MOUNTAIN 8480 Conqueror, (NO SUBSTITUTIONS 
NAVY/GREY(LINED), Offer sizes Extra Small thru 6XL or largest size available. 

TRI MOUNTAIN 8480 CONQUEROR EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

142

DRESS SHIRT, BLUE GENERATIONS, ROYAL BLUE, S/S, MEN, #7216S; offer sizes 
Extra Small thru 5XL.  Provide costs for extended sizes, as applicable. 
Embroidered CIV Logo (Department will provide replica if not on file with 
vendor) on Left Chest; CALEA logo sewn just above top stitch hem of Left S/S; 
Job Title to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on order form

BLUE 
GENERATIONS

7216S, with applied 
LOGO

Blue Generations No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,300.00 T & T $52.00  NO BID $52.00  NO BID 

143

DRESS SHIRT, BLUE GENERATIONS,  ROYAL BLUE, S/S, WOMEN, #6216S; offer 
sizes Small thru 4XL. Embroidered CIV Logo (Department will provide replica if 
not on file with vendor) on Left Chest; CALEA logo sewn just above top stitch 
hem of Left S/S; Job Titles to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on 
order form

BLUE 
GENERATIONS

6216S, with applied 
LOGO

Blue Generations No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,300.00 T & T $52.00  NO BID $52.00  NO BID 

144

DRESS SHIRT, BLUE GENERATIONS,  ROYAL  BLUE, L/S, WOMEN, #6216L; offer 
sizes Small thru 4XL. Embroidered CIV Logo (Department will provide replica if 
not on file with vendor) on Left Chest; CALEA logo sewn just above top snitch 
hem of Left S/S; Job Titles to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on 
order form

BLUE 
GENERATIONS

6216L, with applied 
LOGO

Blue Generations No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,325.00 T & T $53.00  NO BID $53.00  NO BID 

145

DRESS SHIRT, BLUE GENERATIONS,  ROYAL  BLUE, L/S, MEN, #7216L, ; offer 
sizes Extra Small thru 5XL. Embroidered CIV Logo (Department will provide 
replica if not on file with vendor) on Left Chest, CALEA Logo on Left sleeve cuff, 
Job Titles to be applied 1/2" above logo will be provided on order form

BLUE 
GENERATIONS

7216L, with applied 
LOGO

Blue Generations No 
exceptions

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

$1,325.00 T & T $53.00  NO BID $53.00  NO BID 

146 NEW BACKPACK : Maxpedition Prepared Citizen Classic v2.0 Backpack, Color: 
Dark Blue or Gray

Maxpedition Maxpedtion or equal 
quality

EA 25
160 Pryor Street, SW, 

Suite J-102, 
Atlanta, GA  30303

 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
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