
Ballasts, Lamps, Light Fixtures and Supplies

BID ID # 19ITBC119850C-GS

Item Description Represet items number

EST. 

QUANITY

UNIT 

COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UN IT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1. Ballasts 13W2/1 13/10 UNV-C 120/277V 10 40 each $17.08 $683.20 $14.45 $578.00 $17.78 $711.20 $14.97 $598.80 $12.68 $507.20

2. Ballasts 18W2/1 18W-UNV-C 120/277V 20 60 each $17.10 $1,026.00 $14.45 $867.00 $18.34 $1,100.40 $14.97 $898.20 $12.19 $731.40

3. Ballasts 26W 2/1 26W 2/1 26W-UNV-C 120/277V 5 100 each $17.18 $1,718.00 $14.45 $1,445.00 $18.34 $1,834.00 $12.83 $1,283.00 $20.86 $2,086.00

4. Ballasts CFL 42W 120/277V ICF 2S42-M2-LD 20 each $23.00 $460.00 $28.89 $577.80 $17.78 $355.60 $14.97 $299.40 $15.80 $316.00

5. Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 2x T8,32 watts, 120/277V 300 each $7.90 $2,370.00 $7.78 $2,334.00 $9.46 $2,838.00 $6.95 $2,085.00 $9.66 $2,898.00

Fluorescent lamps

6. Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 3xT8,32 watts, 50 each $8.50 $425.00 $8.89 $444.50 $10.47 $523.50 $7.49 $374.50 $5.68 $284.00

120/277V Fluorescent lamps

7. Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 4 x T8, 32 150 each $9.99 $1,498.50 $10.00 $1,500.00 $10.94 $1,641.00 $8.56 $1,284.00 $11.81 $1,771.50

watts, 120/277V Fluorescent lamps

8,

Ballast Emergency Flourescent T-8, T-10 or T-12 120/277V 1 

lamp 15 each $58.50 $877.50 $36.62 $549.30 $40.05 $600.75 $74.87 $1,123.05 $44.59 $668.85

9. Ballast 250W MH, 120/277V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each $55.00 $1,375.00 $55.56 $1,389.00 $54.45 $1,361.25 $42.70 $1,067.50 $42.89 $1,072.25

10. Ballast 400W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each $56.50 $1,412.50 $55.56 $1,389.00 $52.49 $1,312.25 $41.08 $1,027.00 $41.19 $1,029.75

11. Ballast 175W MH, 120/277V core & Coil =, Multi Tap 25 each $50.00 $1,250.00 $38.89 $972.25 $45.00 $1,125.00 $27.81 $695.25 $33.36 $834.00

12. Ballast 100W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each $44.50 $1,112.50 $44.45 $1,111.25 $44.45 $1,111.25 $28.82 $720.50 $32.16 $804.00

GROUP B - Lamps & Related Items

13. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 7 WATT DIMMABLE 150 each $6.08 $912.00 $7.13 $1,069.50 $5.98 $897.00 $6.49 $973.50 $10.14 $1,521.00

14. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 10 WATT LED 125 each $10.60 $1,325.00 $7.10 $887.50 $8.97 $1,121.25 $7.01 $876.25 $7.25 $906.25

15. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 14 WATT DIMMABLE 250 each $9.80 $2,450.00 $8.95 $2,237.50 $11.04 $2,760.00 $8.23 $2,057.50 $8.70 $2,175.00

16. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp 9.5 WATT DIMMABLE 60 each $9.32 $559.20 $5.25 $315.00 $7.34 $440.40 $8.53 $511.80 $9.24 $554.40

17.

PHILIPS Compact FL Lamp, 26 watt - PL-C-2 Pin (G24d-3) Base 

- 4, 100K 150 each $1.42 $213.00 $2.15 $322.50 $1.37 $205.50 $3.22 $483.00 $3.69 $553.50

18. GE 97613 Compact FL Lamp F26DBX/841/ECO4P 150 each $1.42 $213.00 $2.15 $322.50 $1.37 $205.50 $3.22 $483.00 $3.98 $597.00

19. GE97610 Compact FL Lamp, F26DBX1 827/4 Pin OR EQUAL 150 each $1.42 $213.00 $2.15 $322.50 $1.37 $205.50 $3.22 $483.00 $4.07 $610.50

20. GE F18DBX 835/ECO 4 Pin Compact FL Lamp 200 each $1.55 $310.00 $2.09 $418.00 $1.48 $296.00 $3.22 $644.00 $3.50 $700.00

21. SYLVANIA CF13DS/835/ECO 300 each $0.92 $276.00 $1.19 $357.00 $0.85 $255.00 $1.49 $447.00 $1.68 $504.00

22. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp F17T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 each $1.80 $720.00 $1.92 $768.00 $1.69 $676.00 $1.98 $792.00 $2.70 $1,080.00

23 PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp F25T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 each $1.70 $680.00 $2.62 $1,048.00 $1.57 $628.00 $2.22 $888.00 $2.39 $956.00

24. PHILLIPS Flourescent Lamp U-Bent FBO 32/841/U6 300 each $4.75 $1,425.00 $6.30 $1,890.00 $4.48 $1,344.00 $4.46 $1,338.00 $8.24 $2,472.00

25. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp, 4 FT, F32T8/841/ECO 10000 each $1.36 $13,600.00 $1.47 $14,700.00 $1.32 $13,200.00 $1.26 $12,600.00 $1.64 $16,400.00

26. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp, 4 FT, F32T8/835/ECO 3000 each $1.37 $4,110.00 $1.47 $4,410.00 $1.32 $3,960.00 $1.26 $3,780.00 $2.31 $6,930.00

27.

GE Flourescent Lamp, F31T8/SPX35/U - 31 Watt - T8 -U- 

Bend 1-5/8 in. Spacing 300 each $6.05 $1,815.00 $6.52 $1,956.00 5.69 $1,707.00 $5.95 $1,785.00 $5.50 $1,650.00

28. SYLVANIA Flourescent Lamp, FBO31/841 U-Bend 300 each $6.05 $1,815.00 $6.52 $1,956.00 $5.69 $1,707.00 $5.95 $1,785.00 $7.76 $2,328.00

29. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 250W DC 130 V 25 each $7.80 $195.00 $4.47 $111.75 $2.75 $68.75 $4.10 $102.50 $19.11 $477.75

30. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 250W MC 130 V 25 each $7.80 $195.00 $3.91 $97.75 $2.75 $68.75 $4.10 $102.50 $15.50 $387.50

31. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 150W MC 130 V 25 each $8.89 $222.25 $4.72 $118.00 $1.80 $45.00 $4.10 $102.50 $18.98 $474.50

32. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 150W DC 130 V 25 each $7.77 $194.25 $5.63 $140.75 $7.36 $184.00 $4.10 $102.50 $16.95 $423.75

33. LED Lamp 9.5 WATT A-19 2200-2700K 100 each $5.25 $525.00 $4.81 $481.00 $1.59 $159.00 $2.70 $270.00 $3.12 $312.00

34. LED Lamp 12WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 each $7.58 $758.00 $5.90 $590.00 $6.96 $696.00 $3.85 $385.00 $6.65 $665.00

35. LED Lamp 16 WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 each $6.09 $609.00 $6.75 $675.00 $5.81 $581.00 $4.59 $459.00 $9.00 $900.00

36. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 each $134.00 $3,350.00 $171.05 $4,276.25 $43.69 $1,092.25 $120.06 $3,001.50 NO BID NO BID 

37. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 each $48.95 $1,468.50 $65.79 $1,973.70 $39.94 $1,198.20 $48.21 $1,446.30 NO BID NO BID 

38. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 each $50.62 $1,518.60 $65.79 $1,973.70 $39.94 $1,198.20 $48.21 $1,446.30 NO BID NO BID 

39. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 each $48.00 $1,200.00 $61.72 $1,543.00 $33.69 $842.25 $43.19 $1,079.75 NO BID NO BID 

40.

MH Lamp, 100 watts, Meduim Base E-17, Avg life 10000+ hrs 

Open/Close Fixture Syl#64417 50 each $11.10 $555.00 $13.52 $676.00 $10.53 $526.50 $18.83 $941.50 $15.69 $784.50

41. MH Lamp, 175 watts Mogul Base, E-28, Avg life 10000+hrs 75 each $9.99 $749.25 $10.24 $768.00 $9.47 $710.25 $9.91 $743.25 $12.17 $912.75

42. MH Lamp, 250 watts, Mogul Base, E-28, Avg life 10000+rs 75 each $8.98 $673.50 $10.24 $768.00 $8.43 $632.25 $9.91 $743.25 $12.17 $912.75

43. MH Lamp, 400 watts, Mogul Base, E-28 Avg life 10000+hrs 75 each $8.98 $673.50 $10.74 $805.50 $8.43 $632.25 $15.01 $1,125.75 $17.35 $1,301.25

44. Lamp, MH 400 watts, BT-37 75 each $8.97 $672.75 $10.24 $768.00 $8.32 $624.00 $9.01 $675.75 $12.74 $955.50

45. MH Lamp, 175 watts Mogul Base, E-17, Avg life 10000+hrs 50 each $8.87 $443.50 $100.90 $504.50 $8.43 $421.50 $14.65 $732.50 $17.95 $897.50

GROUP C - Light Fixtures, Lens and Related Items

46.

Lay-In type, 2 FtX4 2GTL4 SWL MVOLT LP840 LED 120V-277V 

82 CRI 4000K 25 each $68.90 $1,722.50 $61.05 $1,526.25 $73.56 $1,839.00 $80.94 $2,023.50 $70.00 $1,750.00

47. Lay-In type, 2 FtX2 Ft 2GTL2 A12 120 LP840 LED 120V 30 each $58.50 $1,755.00 $50.62 $1,518.60 $52.34 $1,570.20 $37.63 $1,128.90 $60.00 $1,800.00

48. Lay-in type, 2 FtX2 Ft, U Bent Lamp Electronic ballast 120V 10 each $53.29 $532.90 $65.79 $657.90 NO BID NO BID $40.34 $403.40 NO BID NO BID 

49. Light Fixture, Exit/Emergency Light Combo, Cat. No. LHQM S W 3R 120/277 15 each $39.98 $599.70 $97.52 $1,462.80 $17.25 $258.75 $57.52 $862.80 $98.50 $1,477.50

50. WALL PACK LED 13 WATT 120/277V 12each $75.00 $900.00 $106.81 $1,281.72 $74.71 $896.52 $78.24 $938.88 $107.81 $1,293.72

51. WALL PACK LED 20 WATT 120/277V 15 15 each $108.50 $1,627.50 $151.08 $2,266.20 $109.00 $1,635.00 $109.90 $1,648.50 $152.00 $2,280.00

52. WALL PACK LED 32WATT 120/277V 15 each $132.00 $1,980.00 $342.11 $5,131.65 $109.00 $1,635.00 $115.55 $1,733.25 $355.00 $5,325.00

53. WALL PACK LED 153 WATT 120/277V 15 each $429.00 $6,435.00 $578.95 $8,684.25 $343.68 $5,155.20 $678.19 $10,172.85 $625.00 $9,375.00

TOTAL BIDS & TOTAL $ 1 $74,400.10 3 $84,937.37 27 $66,792.17 18 $73,755.18 4 $85,646.57

Received 5

4898 S. Atlanta Rd SE 

Atlanta, GA 30337, 

Randy Lagod,               

404-307-8504

3295 Kylee Dawn Circle 

Lawrenceville, GA 

30045,  James Warren,           

678-525-2676

DETAIL BID TABULATION SHEET

VENDOR

E. Sam Jones 

Distributor Inc. 

VENDOR

Summit Lighting 

Solutions

VS0000073032 VS0000069535

Purchasing Agent Gertis Strozier

VENDOR

Regency Lighting

VENDOR

Voss Electric Co

VENDOR

Graybar 

  2050 Nancy Hanks Drive     

Norcross, GA   30021, 

Steve Pusteer,              678-

945-9970

VC0000100030 VS0000005328 GRAY520499-A
333 South Grand 

Avenue   Suite 800, Los 

Angeles, CA   90071, 

DAVID POISAL,          

770-795-1876

2129 Northwest Pkwy SE   

Suite 129, Marietta, GA 

30067, Daniel Miller,           

770-438-8557 



Item 

No. Item Description
EST. 

QUANITY

Manufacture/Brand 

Part Number U/P TOTAL COST

1. Ballasts 13W2/1 13/10 UNV-C 120/277V 43 each

PHILIPS ADVANCEICF-

2S13-H1-LD or Equal $19.10 $821.30

2. Ballasts 18W2/1 18W-UNV-C 120/277V 60 each

Universal

C218UNVME $20.50 $1,230.00

3. Ballasts 26W 2/1 26W 2/1 26W-UNV-C 120/277V 100 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

ICF-2S26-H1-LD or $19.20 $1,920.00

4. Ballasts CFL 42W 120/277V ICF 2S42-M2-LD 20 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

ICF-2S42-M2-LD or

Equal $20.60 $412.00

5.

Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 2x T8,32 watts, 120/277V 

Fluorescent lamps 300 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

ICN2P32N35I

or Equal $9.40 $2,820.00

7. Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 4 x T8, 32 watts, 120/277V 150 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

ICN4P32N or Equal $11.20 $1,680.00

8.

Ballast Emergency Flourescent T-8, T-10 or T-12 

120/277V 1 lamp 15 each

Bodine - B100

or Equal $58.90 $883.50

9. Ballast 250W MH, 120/277V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

71A5750-001D $79.50 $1,987.50

10. Ballast 400W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

71A6051-001D

or Equal $107.64 $2,691.00

11. Ballast 175W MH, 120/277V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

71A5570-001D

or Equal $62.18 $1,554.50

12. Ballast 100W MH, 120/277 V core & Coil, Multi Tap 25 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

71A5390-001D

or Equal $68.50 $1,712.50

Ballasts, Lamps, Light Fixtures and Realted Supplies

BID  # 22ITBC135037C-GS BID TABULATION SHEET

VENDOR

E. Sam Jones 

4898 S. Atlanta Rd SE 

Atlanta, GA 30337, 

Randy Lagod,               

404-307-8504

VS0000073032

$557.50

GROUP B - Lamps & Related Items

6. 50 each

PHILIPS ADVANCE

ICN3P32N35I or

Equal

Electronic Ballast for 4 ft, 3xT8,32 watts, 120/277V 

Fluorescent lamps $11.15

GROUP A - Ballasts



13. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 7 WATT DIMMABLE 150 each

7PAR20/LED/F40/840

/E26/GL/DIM 120V

471151 or Equal $2.42 $363.00

14. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 10 WATT LED 125 each

10PAR30L/LED/840/F

25/DIM/ULW/120V

529727 or Equal $6.96 $870.00

15. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp, 14 WATT DIMMABLE 250 each

PHILIPS

14PAR38/LED/F40/

DIM/ULW/120V

529552 or Equal $6.50 $1,625.00

16. PHILIPS LED Flood Lamp 9.5 WATT DIMMABLE 60 each

8.5PAR20/PER/927/F

25/DIM/EC/120V

6/1FB 535260 or

Equal $3.53 $211.80

17.

PHILIPS Compact FL Lamp, 26 watt - PL-C-2 Pin 

(G24d-3) Base - 4, 100K 150 each

PHILIPS 26 watt - PLC

- 2-Pin (G24d-3)

Base - 4,100K 383240

or Equal $2.70 $405.00

18. GE 97613 Compact FL Lamp F26DBX/841/ECO4P 150 each

GE

F26DBX/841/ECO4P

97613 or Equal $2.75 $412.50

19.

GE97610 Compact FL Lamp, F26DBX1 827/4 Pin OR 

EQUAL 150 each

GE PLC26/E/27-39

97610

or Equal $2.46 $369.00

20. GE F18DBX 835/ECO 4 Pin Compact FL Lamp 200 each

GE F18DBX 835/ECO

4 Pin

97600 or Equal $2.85 $570.00

21. SYLVANIA CF13DS/835/ECO 300 each

SYLVANIA

CF13DS/835/ECO

21137 or Equal $2.12 $636.00

22. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp F17T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 each

PHILIPS

F17T8/TL841 ALTO

T8 or Equal $2.37 $948.00

23 PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp F25T8/TL841 ALTO T8 400 each

PHILIPS

or Equal

F25T8/TL841 ALTO

T8 $2.12 $848.00

24. PHILLIPS Flourescent Lamp U-Bent FBO 32/841/U6 300 each

PHILIPS FBO 

32/841/U6 ALTO or

Equal $7.55 $2,265.00

25. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp, 4 FT, F32T8/841/ECO 10,000 each

PHILIPS

F32T8/841/ECO or

Equal $2.25 $22,500.00

26. PHILIPS Flourescent Lamp, 4 FT, F32T8/835/ECO 3,000 each

PHILIPS

F32T8/835/ECO

or Equal $2.35 $7,050.00

27.

GE Flourescent Lamp, F31T8/SPX35/U - 31 Watt - T8 

-U- Bend 1-5/8 in. Spacing 300 each

GE F31T8/SPX35/U -

31 Watt - T8 - U-Bend

1-5/8 in. Spacing

or Equal $9.10 $2,730.00



28. SYLVANIA Fluorescent Lamp, FBO31/841 U-Bend 300 each

SYLVANIA

FBO31/841 U-Bend 1-

5/8 in. Spacing or $9.10 $2,730.00

29. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz lamp, 250W DC 130 V 25 each

SYLVANIA 250W DC

130 V or Equal $14.95 $373.75

30. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 250W MC 130 V 25 each

SYLVANIA 250W MC

130V RODUCT

CODE 460614 or $9.26 $231.50

31. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 150W MC 130 V 25 each

SYLVANIA

150Q/CL/MC 130V or

Equal $10.25 $256.25

32. SYLVANIA Tungsten Quartz Lamp 150W DC 130 V 25 each

SYLVANIA

Q150CL/DC 130V

or Equal $10.25 $256.25

33. LED Lamp 9.5 WATT A-19 2200-2700K 100 each

PHILIPS

9.5A19/PER/827-

22/P/E26/WG 120V or

Equal $1.85 $185.00

34. LED Lamp 12WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 each

PHILIPS

12A21/PER/827/P/E2

6/DIM 120V or Equal $5.30 $530.00

35. LED Lamp 16 WATT A-21 2200-2700K 100 each

PHILIPS

16A21/PER/827/P/E2

6/DIM 120V or Equal $8.63 $863.00

36. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 each

Light Efficient Design

LEFLED 8027M42K

MOG $70.50 $1,762.50

37. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 each

Light Efficient Design

LED 8024M57A MOG

BASE $44.90 $1,347.00

38. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 30 each

Light Efficient Design

LED 8024E57A MED $35.04 $1,051.20

39. LAMP LED CORN COBB 120-277V 25 each

Light Efficient Design

LED 8033M57A MOG

BASE $36.00 $900.00

40.

MH Lamp, 100 watts, Meduim Base E-17, Avg life 

10000+ hrs Open/Close Fixture Syl#64417 50 each

PHILIPS

250MHC100/U/MP/3K

42367-3 or Equal $15.90 $795.00

41.

MH Lamp, 175 watts Mogul Base, E-28, Avg life 

10000+hrs 75 each

PHILIPS

250MH/U

27484-5 or Equal $21.05 $1,578.75

42.

MH Lamp, 250 watts, Mogul Base, E-28, Avg life 

10000+rs 75 each

PHILIPS

MH250/U

27484-5 or Equal $11.50 $862.50

43.

MH Lamp, 400 watts, Mogul Base, E-28 Avg life 

10000+hrs 75 each

PHILIPS

MH400/U/ED28

426023 or Equal $13.10 $982.50



44. Lamp, MH 400 watts, BT-37 75 each

PHILIPS

MH400/U/ED28

274498 or Equal $11.95 $896.25

45.

MH Lamp, 175 watts Mogul Base, E-17, Avg life 

10000+hrs 50 each

PHILIPS

MH250/U/M

31358-5 or Equal $12.95 $647.50

46.

Lay-In type, 2 FtX4 2GTL4 SWL MVOLT LP840 LED 

120V-277V 82 CRI 4000K 25 each

Lithonia

2GTL4 SWL MVOLT

LP840 $94.50 $2,362.50

47.

Lay-In type, 2 FtX2 Ft 2GTL2 A12 120 LP840 LED 

120V 30 each

Lithonia

2GTL2 A12 120

LP840 $65.16 $1,954.80

48.

Lay-in type, 2 FtX2 Ft, U Bent Lamp Electronic ballast 

120V 10 each

Cooper 2G-U6A-

120V-LE3-U $105.90 $1,059.00

49.

Light Fixture, Exit/Emergency Light Combo, Cat. No. 

LHQM S W 3R 120/277 15 each

Lithonia LHQM S W

3R 120/277 Lithonia 

LHQM LED

R M6 $46.50 $697.50

50. WALL PACK LED 13 WATT 120/277V 12each

LITHONIA

OLWX1 LED 13W 50K 

DDB or Equal $64.50 $774.00

51. WALL PACK LED 20 WATT 120/277V 15 each

LITHONIA

OLWX1 LED 20W

50K DDB M4 or Equal $79.50 $1,192.50

52. WALL PACK LED 32WATT 120/277V 15 each

HUBBELL

LIGHTING PVL3-

180L-5K-035-U-DB

or Equal $104.50 $1,567.50

53. WALL PACK LED 153 WATT 120/277V 15 each 

HUBBELL

LIGHTING LNC4-

44L-4K-105-4-U-DB-

7PR or Equal $160.90 $2,413.50

GROUP C - Light Fixtures, Lens and Related Items

TOTAL COST AMOUNT (Base Bid) $88,343.35

TOTAL COST (lines Items #1 - #53) $88,343.35



U/P TOTAL COST U/P TOTAL COST U/P TOTAL COST U/P TOTAL COST

$17.97 $718.96 $27.52 $1,100.80 $16.42 $706.06 $24.65 $986.00

$16.39 $983.40 $29.94 $1,796.40 $17.75 $1,065.00 $33.64 $2,018.40

$14.59 $1,459.00 $19.65 $1,965.00 $16.42 $1,065.00 $23.41 $2,341.00

$20.66 $413.20 $19.65 $393.00 $20.96 $419.20 $28.74 $574.80

$10.32 $3,096.00 $10.33 $3,099.00 $10.01 $3,003.00 $13.46 $4,038.00

$14.16 $2,124.00 $12.96 $1,944.00 $12.59 $1,888.50 $15.58 $2,337.00

$62.29 $934.35 $47.72 $715.80 $76.87 $1,153.05 $62.46 $936.90

$87.41 $2,185.25 $78.92 $1,973.00 $75.26 $1,881.50 $91.08 $2,277.00

$75.66 $1,891.50 $83.69 $2,092.25 $72.44 $1,811.00 $99.08 $2,477.00

$50.90 $1,272.50 $61.98 $1,549.50 $60.44 $1,511.00 $75.89 $1,897.25

$64.03 $1,600.75 $56.22 $1,405.47 $77.67 $1,941.75 $91.41 $2,285.25

BID TABULATION SHEET

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

Summit Lighting Regency Lighting

3295 Kylee Dawn Circle 

Lawrenceville, GA 

30045,                                    

James Warren,           678-

525-2676

333 South Grand Avenue   

Suite 800,                                         

Los Angeles, CA   90071, 

DAVID POISAL,                                                             

770-795-1876

2129 Northwest Pkwy SE   

Suite 129                                                    

Marietta, GA 30067                                         

Russell Hanak                                      

770-438-8557 

  8141-D Technology Drive                              

Covington, GA   30014                                         

Dean Krontz                                    

404-989-5704

Voss Electric Co Electrical Contractor Inc

VS0000069535 VC0000100030 VS0000005328

$12.31 $615.50 $11.13 $556.50

GROUP B - Lamps & Related Items

$11.18

GROUP A - Ballasts

$559.00 $17.79 $889.50



$10.64 $1,596.00 $4.53 $679.50 $6.53 $979.50 $8.86 $1,329.00

$16.64 $2,080.00 $8.01 $1,001.25 $6.91 $863.75 $11.40 $1,425.00

$21.20 $5,300.00 $9.87 $2,467.50 $8.21 $2,052.50 $12.89 $3,222.05

$10.64 $638.40 $11.43 $685.80 $10.15 $609.00 $6.89 $413.40

$3.52 $528.00 $3.37 $505.60 $3.62 $543.00 $9.49 $1,423.50

$3.46 $519.00 $2.40 $360.00 $3.62 $543.00 $5.03 $754.50

$3.46 $519.00 $3.43 $514.50 $3.62 $543.00 $3.84 $576.00

$4.81 $962.00 $3.49 $698.00 $3.62 $724.00 $7.98 $1,596.00

$3.27 $981.00 $2.16 $648.00 $2.60 $780.00 $5.08 $1,527.00

$2.53 $1,012.00 $2.67 $1,066.67 $3.64 $1,456.00 $4.05 $1,620.00

$3.48 $1,392.00 $2.52 $1,008.00 $3.64 $1,456.00 $4.53 $1,812.00

$10.18 $3,054.00 $9.36 $2,808.00 $9.04 $2,712.00 $11.46 $3,438.00

$2.19 $21,900.00 $1.91 $19,100.00 $2.29 $22,900.00 $3.09 $30,900.00

$2.19 $6,570.00 $2.72 $8,160.00 $2.48 $7,440.00 $3.09 $9,270.00

$10.50 $3,150.00 9.98 $2,994.00 $10.85 $3,255.00 $12.33 $3,699.00



$10.50 $3,150.00 $9.98 $2,994.00 $10.85 $3,255.00 $12.33 $3,699.00

$2.39 $59.75 $16.88 $422.00 $2.86 $71.50 $24.23 $605.75

$2.33 $58.25 $10.01 $250.25 $2.07 $51.75 $23.11 $577.75

$3.52 $88.00 $21.90 $547.50 $2.75 $68.75 $17.11 $427.75

$3.52 $88.00 $15.80 $395.00 $3.36 $84.00 $20.39 $509.75

No Bid No Bid $4.44 $444.00 $3.19 $319.00 $2.30 $230.00

No Bid No Bid $4.87 $487.00 $4.87 $487.00 $5.75 $575.00

No Bid No Bid $5.60 $560.00 $4.71 $471.00 $5.43 $543.00

$118.33 $2,958.25 $79.82 $1,995.50 $125.10 $3,127.50 $188.95 $4,723.75

$50.56 $1,516.80 $48.20 $1,446.00 $50.68 $1,520.40 $53.05 $1,591.50

$50.56 $1,516.80 $39.69 $1,190.70 $50.68 $1,520.40 $75.99 $2,279.70

$41.11 $1,027.75 $37.80 $945.00 $44.11 $1,102.75 $101.51 $2,537.75

No Bid No Bid $20.72 $1,036.00 $32.38 $1,619.00 $24.35 $1,217.50

$14.04 $1,053.00 $12.92 $969.00 $13.88 $1,041.00 $18.46 $1,384.50

$14.04 $1,053.00 $12.92 $969.00 $13.88 $1,041.00 $18.88 $1,416.00

$14.74 $1,105.50 $13.20 $990.00 $18.67 $1,400.25 $21.49 $1,611.75



No Bid No Bid $10.72 $804.00 $13.88 $1,041.00 $14.51 $1,088.25

No Bid No Bid $18.30 $915.00 $13.71 $685.50 $14.51 $725.50

$121.94 $3,048.50 $104.83 $2,605.00 $83.10 $2,077.50 $80.46 $2,011.50

$59.00 $1,770.00 $72.02 $2,160.60 $41.16 $1,234.80 $55.23 $1,656.09

$10.32 $103.20 NO BID NO BID $71.33 $713.30 $62.38 $623.80

$95.56 $1,433.40 $54.93 $823.95 $59.62 $894.30 $57.48 $862.20

$66.67 $800.04 $70.83 $849.96 $62.35 $748.20 $139.98 $1,679.76

$83.33 $1,249.95 $78.54 $1,178.10 $62.35 $935.25 $195.39 $2,930.85

$427.78 $6,416.70 $125.31 $1,879.65 $186.33 $2,794.95 $189.63 $2,844.45

$361.11 $5,416.65 $188.16 $2,822.40 $597.63 $8,964.45 $121.63 $1,824.45

$127,674.35

$90,967.14

GROUP C - Light Fixtures, Lens and Related Items

$101,409.35 $90,967.40 $101,707.36

$101,409.35 $101,707.36 $127,674.35


