
OPENING 

Date:7/10/2021
Closing Date: 

8/10/2021

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

VENDOR 

NAME

Best Plumbing 

Specialties
Equiparts Corp

INTERLINE 

BRANDS

South K & A 

Specialty Parts

Tiles in Style 

d.b.a.Taza 

Supplies

Total Maintenance 

Solutions South
WW Grainger

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS

PO Box 30     

Myersville   MD   

21773 

PO Box 464     

Oakmont   PA   

15139 

701 San Marco 

Boulevard     

Jacksonville   FL   

32207 

Northcrest Dr.     

Newnan   GA   

30265 

  697 Executive 

dr     Willow 

Brook   IL   

60527 

  3540 

Rutherford Road     

Taylors   SC   

29687

  6655 

CRESCENT 

DRIVE     

NORCROSS   

GA   30071

TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE

800-448-6710 412-781-8181 800-476-5830 404-510-2277 630-219-1978 864-268-2891       

Ext 115

888-803-7320

CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT: CONTACT:

Missy Baugher
Nikki 

DiDomenico
Nancy Stack Jim Bass FRANK RIAZ Edith Bryson

MONICA 

WECKHERLIN

No Description of Item Quatity Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost

1 WATER HEATER, REEM, 40 GAL 8 NO BID NO BID 13501.68 16312 5076 NO BID 13419.92

2 WATER HEATER, REEM, 80 GAL 6 NO BID NO BID 12834 10110 8829 NO BID 15506.16

3
WATER HEATER, INSTANT FLOW 2400, W 

120v
10

NO BID 2535.3 1450 2250 2501.9 NO BID 1635.5

4
WATER HEATER, INSTANT FLOW 5540, W 

277v
18

NO BID 5978.7 2610 4050 5127.3 NO BID 3146.76

5 EXPANSION TANK, 2.1 Gal 12 NO BID 848.04 299.88 288 498.12 513.6 806.76

6
WATER COOLER , HALSEY

TAYLOR 8 GA
8

NO BID 8891.76 5677.04 7288 15970.16 7200 9305.2

7 WATER COOLER,  ELKAY 8 G 6
NO BID 3139.44 2334 2784 5670 3157.5 3641.58

8
WATER COOLER, FILTER

AMERICAN PLUMBER 3/8”
15

NO BID 285 369.75 405 451.05 240.75 253.65

9 FAUCET,  GERBER 4'' 24 2448.72 2760 2094.72 2448 3534 2592 NO BID

10 FAUCET 8'' SPREAD GERBER 18 2293.02 2584.26 1819.26 1962 5317.02 2584.26 NO BID

11 FAUCET AUTO ZURN 4’’ 24 7302 7811.52 7199.76 8112 8407.92 7662 10116.72

12 FAUCET 8'' SPREAD DELTA 18 1181.16 1759.68 891 1566 1423.26 1439.82 1591.56

13
PRE RINSE SPRAY

VALVE REGENCY 1.42 
10

NO BID 599.9 499.9 600 1499 NO BID 783.1

14
TOILET AMERICAN

STANDARD 1.28 gal
18

NO BID 4840.92 5490 1602 5911.74 NO BID 4772.7

15
URINAL AMERICAN

STANDARD 5 GAL
18

NO BID 4061.7 7830 2142 6431.4 NO BID NO BID

16 PRESSURE TANK KOHLER 1.0. 6 NO BID 1921.68 1259.94 1224 2353.38 NO BID NO BID

17 AUTO FLUSH VALVE SLOAN 15 – 80 PSI 40 6864 6946.8 6069.2 6440 24729.2 7120 8286.4

18
MANUAL FLUSH

VALVE SLOAN 1 GAL
12

1209 1200 1188 1092 1730.16 1259.52 1556.28

19
FLUSH VALVE REPAIR

KIT SLOAN 1.5GPF A-37
100

1196 1320 1399 1600 3002 1182 870

20
FLUSH VALVE REPAIR

KIT SLOAN 4.5GPF A-36
150

1794 1980 2047.5 2400 2886 1837.5 1305

21
DRAIN OPENER GRAN

1LB THRIFT 2LB
120

NO BID 740.4 2158.8 1200 1080 NO BID NO BID

22 VALVE FLUIDMASTER FLUIDMASTER 60 509.4 670.2 378 540 548.4 489 401.4

23

TOILET SEAT

ELONGATED OPEN

END NO COVER

BEMIS

50

1185 1519 1024.5 1000 1791 1400 633

24 SPUD BRASS PRO PLUS 1-1/2IN 48 293.28 352.8 287.52 288 502.56 355.2 177.12

25 SPUD BRASS PRO PLUS 3/4IN 24 91.44 106.32 124.8 96 235.44 99.12 185.52

TOTAL  $             26,367.02  $         62,853.42  $             80,838.25  $             77,799.00  $           115,506.01  $             39,132.27  $             78,394.33 

Award Lines Sum

Number of the Lowest Items 25 21 
3,4,6,7,9,10,11,

12,13,17,22
5,14,15,16,18 1,2 8  19,20,23,24 

BIDS MAILED

BIDS RECEIVED: 7
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BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER: 21ITBC130825C-MH

BID DESCRIPTION:  Plumbing Supplies and Related Items

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT:  Department of Real Estate and 

Asset Management

CAPA, Mark Hawk

Contracting Officer: S KIM
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